
Tuesday, January 13, 2026

CITY COUNCIL MEETING

CITY COUNCIL

MAYOR
CLAUDIA M. FROMETA

Regular Meeting
5:30 p.m. - Closed Session
6:30 p.m. - Open Session

MAYOR PRO TEM
HORACIO ORTIZ

 Council Chambers
11111 Brookshire Avenue

Downey, CA 90241

COUNCIL MEMBERS
DOROTHY PEMBERTON
HECTOR SOSA
MARIO TRUJILLO
 

 

Notice regarding Public Comment: In order to ensure that limited English proficiency speakers receive the same opportunity to directly

address the City Council, the City of Downey will continue to follow Government Code Section 54954.3(b)(2) and provide limited English

proficiency speakers double the allotted time to make their public comments utilizing a translator during public meetings of the City

Council. All other speakers will be given the allotted 3-minute speaking time for public hearing and closed session items, and one 3-minute

speaking time for agenda, consent calendar and non-agenda items established by the Downey Municipal Code. To request oral language

interpretation at a City Council meeting contact the City Clerk's Office at (562) 904-7280, 48-hours in advance of the meeting.

CALL TO ORDER THE REGULAR CITY COUNCIL MEETING – CLOSED SESSION - 5:30 P.M.

ROLL CALL

Council Members Pemberton, Sosa, Trujillo, Mayor Pro Tem Ortiz, Mayor Frometa

PUBLIC COMMENT ON CLOSED SESSION AGENDA ITEMS

(Persons wishing to address the City Council on any item on the Closed Session Agenda items may do so at this
time. Please limit your comments to no more than three (3) minutes, unless otherwise limited by the Mayor for
good cause including number of speakers, as permitted by the City’s meeting rules.

RECESS TO A CLOSED SESSION OF THE CITY COUNCIL UNDER THE FOLLOWING AUTHORITIES:

1. Government Code Section 54957(b)(1) – Public Employee Performance Evaluation – Title: City Clerk.

2. Government Code Section 54957.6(a) – Conference with Labor Negotiator Agency Designated Representative:
James McQueen, Director of Human Resources. Unrepresented Employee: City Clerk.



RECONVENE AND ANNOUNCE CLOSED SESSION ACTION

CALL TO ORDER THE REGULAR CITY COUNCIL MEETING - OPEN SESSION - 6:30 P.M.

ROLL CALL

Council Members Pemberton, Sosa, Trujillo, Mayor Pro Tem Ortiz, Mayor Frometa

INVOCATION

Greg Welch, Chaplain Downey Police Department

FLAG SALUTE

Boy Scout Troop 2

CITY COUNCIL MEMBER ANNOUNCEMENTS; REQUESTS FOR FUTURE AGENDA ITEMS;
CONFERENCE/MEETING REPORTS

CITY MANAGER/STAFF MEMBER COMMENTS

PRESENTATIONS

1. Mayor's Legacy Award to the Downey Rose Float Association for winning the Founder's Trophy at the 137th
Tournament of Roses Parade.

2. Presentation of City Pins to the 2026 Miss and Mr. Downey Court.

3. Presentation to the City Council by the Downey Youth Commission.

PUBLIC HEARINGS

1. ADOPTION OF A RESOLUTION TO ADJUST THE CITY OF DOWNEY WATER RATES

That the City Council:

Adopt Resolution No. 26-8329, approving the adjustments to the City of Downey water rates and making them
effective January 14, 2026.



2. ADOPTION OF URGENCY ORDINANCES ADOPTING THE 2025 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING
STANDARDS CODE AND LOCAL AMENDMENTS THERETO BASED UPON CLIMATIC, TOPOGRAPHICAL,
AND GEOLOGICAL CONDITIONS AND INTRODUCTION OF ORDINANCES ADOPTING THE 2025 EDITION
OF THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS CODE AND LOCAL AMENDMENTS THERETO BASED UPON
CLIMATIC, TOPOGRAPHICAL, AND GEOLOGICAL CONDITIONS



That the City Council adopt the following Urgency Ordinances:

Adopt Urgency Ordinance No. 26-1531, Repealing and Recasting Chapter 1 (Downey Building Code) of Article
VIII (Building Regulations) of the Downey Municipal Code; Adopting by Reference the 2025 California Building
Standards Code (California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Incorporating and Amending the 2024 International
Building Code) – Including Appendix H; and Making Certain Local Additions and Amendments Thereto;

Adopt Urgency Ordinance No. 26-1532, Repealing and Recasting Section 8730 (Grading Regulations) of
Chapter 8 (Floodplain Management, Grading and Paving) of the Downey Municipal Code and Adding a New
Section 8730 (Downey Grading Regulations) to Chapter 8 (Floodplain Management, Grading and Paving) of the
Downey Municipal Code by Adopting by Reference Appendix J of the 2025 California Building Code (California
Code Of Regulations, Title 24, Part 2); and Making Certain Local Amendments Thereto;

Adopt Urgency Ordinance No. 26-1533, Repealing and Recasting Chapter 13 (Downey Residential Code) of
Article VIII (Building Regulations) of the Downey Municipal Code; Adopting by Reference the 2025 California
Residential Code (California Code Of Regulations, Title 24, Part 2.5) and Appendices BB, BF, BG, and C1; and
Making Certain Local Additions and Amendments Thereto; and,

Adopt Urgency Ordinance No. 26-1534,  Amending Chapters 3, 4, 5, and 6 of Article III of the Downey Municipal
Code and Adopting by Reference the 2025 California Fire Code (California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part
9), Including Appendices A Through O, Together with Certain Additions, Insertions, Deletions and Changes
Thereto, for the Purpose of Prescribing Regulations Governing Conditions Hazardous to Life and Property from
Fire or Explosion; and Adopting Chapter 6.95 of Division 20 of the California Health and Safety Code for the
Purpose of Prescribing Regulations Governing Conditions Hazardous to Life and Property from the Handling,
Use, Storage or Release of Hazardous Materials or Hazardous Waste.

That the City Council introduce the following Ordinances and schedule a Public Hearing on January 27, 2026:

Introduce an Ordinance Repealing and Recasting Chapter 1 (Downey Building Code) of Article VIII (Building
Regulations) of the Downey Municipal Code; Adopting by Reference the 2025 California Building Standards
Code (California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Incorporating and Amending the 2024 International Building
Code) – Including Appendix H; and Making Certain Local Additions and Amendments Thereto;

Introduce an Ordinance Repealing and Recasting Section 8730 (Grading Regulations) of Chapter 8 (Floodplain
Management, Grading and Paving) of the Downey Municipal Code and Adding a New Section 8730 (Downey
Grading Regulations) to Chapter 8 (Floodplain Management, Grading and Paving) of the Downey Municipal
Code by Adopting by Reference Appendix J of the 2025 California Building Code (California Code of
Regulations, Title 24, Part 2); and Making Certain Local Amendments Thereto;

Introduce an Ordinance Repealing and Recasting Chapter 13 (Downey Residential Code) of Article VIII (Building
Regulations) of the Downey Municipal Code; Adopting by Reference the 2025 California Residential Code
(California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 2.5) and Appendices BB, BF, BG, And C1; and Making Certain
Local Additions and Amendments Thereto; and,

Introduce an Ordinance Amending Chapters 3, 4, 5, and 6 of Article III of the Downey Municipal Code and
Adopting by Reference the 2025 California Fire Code (California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9), Including
Appendices A Through O, Together with Certain Additions, Insertions, Deletions and Changes Thereto, for the



Purpose of Prescribing Regulations Governing Conditions Hazardous to Life and Property from Fire or
Explosion; and Adopting Chapter 6.95 of Division 20 of the California Health and Safety Code for the Purpose of
Prescribing Regulations Governing Conditions Hazardous to Life and Property from the Handling, Use, Storage
or Release of Hazardous Materials or Hazardous Waste; and,

Introduce an Ordinance Adopting the 2025 Editions of the California Electrical Code, California Mechanical
Code, California Plumbing Code, California Historical Building Code, California Green Building Standards Code,
California Energy Code, California Existing Building Code, and California Referenced Standards Code (as Set
Forth in California Code of Regulations Title 24); and Amending Downey Municipal Code Article VIII (“Building
Regulations”), Chapters 2, 3, 4, 9, 11, 12, 15, and 16 Accordingly.

PUBLIC COMMENT ON AGENDA, CONSENT CALENDAR, AND NON-AGENDA ITEMS

This portion provides an opportunity for the public to address the City Council on agenda, consent calendar and
items not listed on the agenda within the jurisdiction of the City Council. It is requested, but not required, that you
state your name, address and subject matter upon which you wish to speak. Please limit your comments to no
more than three (3) minutes, unless otherwise limited by the Mayor for good cause including number of speakers,
as permitted by the City’s meeting rules. The total public comment period is limited to 30 minutes. Pursuant to the
Brown Act, no discussion or action, other than a brief response, referral to the City Manager/staff or schedule for a
subsequent agenda, shall be taken by the City Council/Agency on any issue brought forth under this section.

CONSENT CALENDAR

All matters listed on the Consent Calendar are to be approved with one motion unless a City Council Member
requests an item be removed. Removed items will be considered following approval of the Consent Calendar.

3. APPROVAL OF COUNCIL MEETING MINUTES

Special meetings of September 17, 2025, November 18, 2025, and December 11, 2025; Regular meetings of
August 26, 2025, September 23, 2025, October 14, 2025, and October 28, 2025.

4. APPROVAL OF WARRANTS ISSUED

Warrant Nos. 394726-395675; Payroll Wire Nos. 30004645-30004649; 30004650-30004655; 30004657-
30004659; 30004661; EFT Nos. 15309-15436; Manual Wire Nos. 2767-2779; and, one Cashier's Check No.
91201, in the total amount of $17,020,499.45.



5. ACCEPTANCE OF WORK FOR THE FISCAL YEAR 2024-25 ANNUAL MISCELLANEOUS CONCRETE
REPAIRS (COUNCIL DISTRICT 2), AMERICAN WITH DISABILITIES ACT AND MISCELLANEOUS
IMPROVEMENTS (CITYWIDE), CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT PROJECT (CIP) NO. 25-01

That the City Council:

1) Accept the work for the FY 2024-25 Annual Miscellaneous Concrete Repairs (Council District 2), Americans
with Disabilities Act and Miscellaneous Improvements (Citywide), CIP No. 25-01;

2) Approve the final construction contract amount of $298,014; and,

3) Authorize the Director of Public Works/City Engineer to file a Notice of Completion indicating the work is
complete and has been accepted by the City.

6. APPROVAL OF A PURCHASE AGREEMENT WITH MARK ENTERPRISES TECHNOLOGIES, LLC FOR THE
PURCHASE OF INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY EQUIPMENT

That the City Council:

1) Approve a purchase agreement between the City of Downey and MARK Enterprises Technologies LLC for the
purchase of Check Point Maestro Model MHO-140 Orchestrator Appliances, including related support and
professional services, in an amount not to exceed $99,236.50, provide retroactive approval of Purchase Order
No. 12-11009 issued on December 29, 2025, and;

2) Authorize the City Manager or his designee to execute all documents necessary to effectuate the purchase.

7. APPROVAL OF COUNCIL MEETING SCHEDULE FOR CALENDAR YEAR 2026

That the City Council:

Approve the Council Meeting Schedule for Calendar Year 2026.

ADMINISTRATIVE REPORTS



8. APPOINTMENTS OF CITY COUNCIL MEMBERS TO INTER-GOVERNMENTAL AGENCIES AND COUNCIL
SUBCOMMITTEES FOR 2026

That the City Council:

1) Approve the City Council appointments to the Inter-Governmental Agencies and Council Subcommittees for
2026; 

2) Ratify the appointment of Mayor Pro Tem Horacio Ortiz to act as alternate member of the Boards of Directors
of County Sanitation District Nos. 2 and 18, of Los Angeles County in the presiding officer's absence effective
December 15, 2025; and,

3) Terminate the Affordable Housing and Tenant's Rights Subcommittee, the Homelessness Subcommittee and,
the Charter Review Ad Hoc Committee. 

ADJOURNMENT

In memory of William Alarcon, 78, former Council Member of the City of Rosemead; James Helms, 100, former
City of Arcadia Mayor; and Mitzi Ortiz, 45, Aliso Viejo City Manager, who also served as Aliso Viejo’s City Clerk
between 2014 and 2024.

FUTURE COUNCIL REQUESTED ITEMS

1. Reimbursement options for outside meetings/conference – (M. Trujillo)
2. Research a Talent Show for Downey – (M. Trujillo)
3. Study adding crosswalks at Castana Ave. near Golden Park – (H. Ortiz)
4. Traffic survey on Cecilia St. from Pangborn Ave. to Woodruff Ave. – (H. Sosa)
5. Review CUP fee structure for small businesses in Downey – (H. Sosa)
6. Conduct speed survey on Fontana St. between Brookshire Ave. and Patton Rd. – ( H. Ortiz)
7. Conduct a survey of traffic signs and stop signs along Brookshire Ave. – (H. Ortiz)

Supporting documents are available at: City Hall-City Clerk’s Department, 11111 Brookshire Avenue, Monday – Friday, 7:30 a.m. – 5:30

p.m.  Video streaming of the meeting is available on the City’s website.  In compliance with the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA), if

special assistance is needed to participate in this meeting, complete the City’s Title II ADA Reasonable Accommodation Form located on

the City’s website and at City Hall - City Clerk’s Department, 11111 Brookshire Avenue, Monday – Friday, 7:30 a.m. – 5:30 p.m., and

submit to the City Clerk’s Department or contact (562) 904-7280 or TTY 7-1-1, 48 business hours prior to the City Council meeting.

 
The City of  Downey prohibits discrimination on the basis of disability in any of its program and services. For questions, concerns,

complaints, or for additional information regarding the ADA, contact the City’s ADA/Section 504 Coordinator at

ADACoordinator@downeyca.org:  Phone: (562) 299-6619; or TTY at 7-1-1.

 
In compliance with Title VI of the Civil Rights Act, the City of Downey prohibits discrimination of any person in any of its program and

services. If written language translation of City agendas or minutes, or for oral language interpretation at a City meeting is needed, contact

the City Clerk's Office at (562) 904-7280, or (562) 299-6619, 48 business hours prior to the meeting.

 

mailto:ADACoordinator@downeyca.org


En cumplimiento con el Título VI de la Ley de Derechos Civiles, la Ciudad de Downey prohíbe la discriminación de cualquier persona en

todos sus programas y servicios. En caso de necesitar una traducción escrita de las órdenes del día o las actas de las reuniones de la

ciudad, o para solicitar un intérprete oral para una reunión de la ciudad, comuníquese a la oficina de la secretaria de la Ciudad al (562)

904-7280, o al (562) 299-6619, en el horario de atención comercial, 48 horas antes de la reunión.

 
I, Maria Alicia Duarte, CMC, City Clerk, City of Downey, do hereby certify, under penalty of perjury under the laws of the State of California

that the foregoing notice was posted pursuant to Government Code Section 54950 Et. Seq., at the following locations: Downey City Hall,

Downey City Library, and Barbara J. Riley Community and Senior Center.

 

Maria Alicia Duarte, CMC, City Clerk
To view the livestream of the Regular Meeting at 6:30 p.m.:

 
Zoom Teleconference: (888) 788-0099 or (877) 853-5247

 
Meeting ID: 842 8892 3601

 
Link:   https://us06web.zoom.us/j/84288923601

 
YouTube:  https://www.youtube.com/c/DowneyCityCouncilMeetings

 
Members of the public wishing to submit written public comment can do so by sending an email to
ccpubliccomment@downeyca.org or by submitting their written comments to the City Clerk’s Office in person no later than
2:00 p.m. on the day of the meeting.
 
Note: All written public comments received shall become public record as defined under the California Public
Records Act.
 

To view the recording of the City Council Meeting at a later time:
https://www.youtube.com/@cityofdowneycouncilmeetings/streams

Date Posted: January 8, 2026

https://us06web.zoom.us/j/84288923601
https://www.youtube.com/c/DowneyCityCouncilMeetings
mailto:ccpubliccomment@downeyca.org
https://www.youtube.com/@cityofdowneycouncilmeetings/streams












https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695bec07130b45004af2ab8c/ATT_A_-_Resolution_No_._26-8329_-_Adopting_New_Water_Rates_-_JMF_atf.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695bec07130b45004af2ab8c/ATT_A_-_Resolution_No_._26-8329_-_Adopting_New_Water_Rates_-_JMF_atf.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695bec07130b45004af2ab8c/ATT_A_-_Resolution_No_._26-8329_-_Adopting_New_Water_Rates_-_JMF_atf.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695bec07130b45004af2ab8c/ATT_B_-_Objection_Protest_Letters___Responses_to_Written_Objections_-_Mailed.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695bec07130b45004af2ab8c/ATT_B_-_Objection_Protest_Letters___Responses_to_Written_Objections_-_Mailed.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695bec07130b45004af2ab8c/ATT_B_-_Objection_Protest_Letters___Responses_to_Written_Objections_-_Mailed.pdf






Resolution No. 26-8329 
Page 3 

of this Resolution will not result in a direct or reasonably foreseeable indirect change to the 
environment and is not defined as a project under CEQA. 

SECTION 4. If any section, subsection, clause or phrase in this Resolution or the 
application thereof to any person or circumstances is for any reason held invalid, the validity of 
the remainder of this Resolution or the application of such provisions to other persons or 
circumstances shall not be affected thereby. The City Council hereby declares that it would 
have passed this Resolution and each section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase thereof, 
irrespective of the fact that one or more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses or phrases 
or the application thereof to any person or circumstance be held invalid. 

SECTION 5. This Resolution shall become effective upon its adoption. 

SECTION 6. The City Clerk shall certify to the adoption of this Resolution. 

APPROVED AND ADOPTED this 13th day of January, 2026. 

_____________________________ 
CLAUDIA M. FROMETA, Mayor  

ATTEST: 

______________________________ 
MARIA ALICIA DUARTE, CMC 
City Clerk  

APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

_______________________________ 
JOHN M. FUNK 
City Attorney 

I HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing Resolution was adopted by the City Council of 
the City of Downey at a Regular meeting held on the 13th day of January, 2026, by the following 
vote, to wit: 

AYES:   Council Members: 
NOES:  Council Members: 
ABSENT:  Council Members: 
ABSTAIN:  Council Members: 

_____________________________ 
MARIA ALICIA DUARTE, CMC 
City Clerk 







CITY OF DOWNEY WATER RATE SCHEDULE

               

Tier

Bi-Monthly Tier 
Breakpoint 

(HCF) Jan  2026 Jan 2027 Jan 2028 Jan 2029 Jan  2030
Tier 1 1000 $1.496 $1.661 $1.844 $2.047 $2.272
Tier 2 5500 $2.374 $2.635 $2.925 $3.247 $3.604
Tier 3 >5,500 $2.933 $3.256 $3.614 $4.012 $4.453

Notes: 
1) Each unit of water flow is equal to 100 cubic feet (HCF) or one Consumption Unit (CU)
2) Accounts with compound water meters shall be billed one bi-monthly volumetric charge equal to the sum of the
water usage associated with both the smaller and larger sides of the compound meter

Connection 
Size

(inches) Jan  2026 Jan 2027 Jan 2028 Jan 2029 Jan  2030
1" $1.01 $1.12 $1.24 $1.38 $1.53

1.5" $2.93 $3.25 $3.61 $4.01 $4.45
2" $6.24 $6.93 $7.69 $8.54 $9.48
3" $18.13 $20.12 $22.33 $24.79 $27.52
4" $38.64 $42.89 $47.61 $52.85 $58.66
6" $112.25 $124.60 $138.31 $153.52 $170.41
8" $239.21 $265.52 $294.73 $327.15 $363.14

10" $430.18 $477.50 $530.03 $588.33 $653.05
12" $694.86 $771.29 $856.13 $950.30 $1,054.83

Notes: 
1) Connection size is the size of the fire service lateral connected to the City's water main

Recycled Water Volumetric Rates

Bi-monthly Fixed Private Fire Protection Charges ($/connection size)

2



ATTACHMENT B







































































https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_A_URGENCY_Ordinance_No._26-1531_-_2025_CA_Building_Code_final.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_A_URGENCY_Ordinance_No._26-1531_-_2025_CA_Building_Code_final.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_A_URGENCY_Ordinance_No._26-1531_-_2025_CA_Building_Code_final.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_B_URGENCY_Ordinance_No._26-1532_-_DMC_8730_-_2025_CA_Building_Code_Appendix_J_final.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_B_URGENCY_Ordinance_No._26-1532_-_DMC_8730_-_2025_CA_Building_Code_Appendix_J_final.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_B_URGENCY_Ordinance_No._26-1532_-_DMC_8730_-_2025_CA_Building_Code_Appendix_J_final.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_C_URGENCY_Ordinance_No._26_-_1533_-_2025_CA_Residential_Code_final.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_C_URGENCY_Ordinance_No._26_-_1533_-_2025_CA_Residential_Code_final.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_C_URGENCY_Ordinance_No._26_-_1533_-_2025_CA_Residential_Code_final.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_D_URGENCY_Ordinance_No._26-_1534_-_2025_CA_Fire_Code_fina.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_D_URGENCY_Ordinance_No._26-_1534_-_2025_CA_Fire_Code_fina.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_D_URGENCY_Ordinance_No._26-_1534_-_2025_CA_Fire_Code_fina.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_E_Proposed_Ordinance__-_2025_CA_Building_Code.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_E_Proposed_Ordinance__-_2025_CA_Building_Code.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_E_Proposed_Ordinance__-_2025_CA_Building_Code.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_F_Proposed_Ordinance_-_DMC_8730_-_2025_CA_Building_Code_Appendix_J.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_F_Proposed_Ordinance_-_DMC_8730_-_2025_CA_Building_Code_Appendix_J.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_F_Proposed_Ordinance_-_DMC_8730_-_2025_CA_Building_Code_Appendix_J.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_G_Proposed_Ordinance__-_2025_CA_Residential_Code.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_G_Proposed_Ordinance__-_2025_CA_Residential_Code.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_G_Proposed_Ordinance__-_2025_CA_Residential_Code.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_H_Proposed_Ordinance_-_2025_CA_Fire_Code.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_H_Proposed_Ordinance_-_2025_CA_Fire_Code.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_H_Proposed_Ordinance_-_2025_CA_Fire_Code.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_I__Proposed_Ordinance_-_2025_CA_Building_Standards-No_Amendments.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_I__Proposed_Ordinance_-_2025_CA_Building_Standards-No_Amendments.pdf
https://s3.us-west-004.backblazeb2.com/agendalink-pdf/downeyca/pdfs/topics/695d8ef8130b45004af87edb/Attachment_I__Proposed_Ordinance_-_2025_CA_Building_Standards-No_Amendments.pdf


ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
 

AN URGENCY ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 
OF DOWNEY REPEALING AND RECASTING CHAPTER 1 
(DOWNEY BUILDING CODE) OF ARTICLE VIII (BUILDING 
REGULATIONS) OF THE DOWNEY MUNICIPAL CODE; 
ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 2025 CALIFORNIA BUILDING 
STANDARDS CODE (CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS, 
TITLE 24, INCORPORATING AND AMENDING THE 2024 
INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE) – INCLUDING APPENDIX H; 
AND MAKING CERTAIN LOCAL ADDITIONS AND AMENDMENTS 
THERETO 

WHEREAS, pursuant to Government Code Section 50022.1 et seq., the City 
of Downey (the "City") may adopt by reference the California Building Standards Code, 
2025 Edition, as provided in Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations; and, 

WHEREAS, Sections 17922, 17958, and 18941.5 of the California Health and 
Safety Code provide that the governing body of every city or county shall adopt 
ordinances or regulations imposing the same requirements as those contained in the 
most recently adopted version of the California Building Standards Code; and, 

 
WHEREAS, the appendices to the California Building Code (inclusive of 

Appendix H) provide optional guidelines for specific topics – including Signs, however, 
the adoption of these appendices by local jurisdictions is not mandatory by their own 
terms; 

 
WHEREAS, Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7, and 18941.5 of the California 

Health & Safety Code provide that a city or county may make such changes or 
modifications to the requirements contained in the California Building Standards Code 
which are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological, or topographical 
conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7, and 18941.5 of the California 
Health & Safety Code provide that prior to making any change or modification to the 
California Building Standards Code authorized by the Health & Safety Code, the City 
Council of the City of Downey is required to make an express finding that such 
modifications or changes are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, 
geological, or topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, as approved by the Governor on June 30, 2025, California 
Assembly Bill 130 (“AB 130”), amongst other actions, amended Health & Safety Code 
Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7, and 18941.5 by prohibiting local jurisdictions from 
making any modifications to the building standards between October 1, 2025 and June 
1, 2031, that affect residential units unless at least one of several specified conditions 
exist, including a finding that the local amendments are “substantially equivalent” to 
prior modifications that were filed by the governing body of the local jurisdiction and 
that were in effect as of September 30, 2025; and, 

WHEREAS, the local amendments incorporated into this Ordinance are 
substantially equivalent to amendments previously enacted by the City Council of the 
City of Downey as a result of local climatic, geological, and/or topographical conditions 
and which were filed with the California Building Standards Commission and in effect  

 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 2 

as of September 30, 2025; and, 
 

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Downey is not required to make an 
express finding for amendments necessary to carry out the application of the Building 
Standards Code and/or that do not otherwise modify a Building Standard; and, 

 
WHEREAS, because the City of Downey is in a liquefaction zone, the flood 

hazard section of this code has been amended; and, 
 

WHEREAS, the City of Downey is in Climate Zone 8 and, therefore, is required 
to have more stringent energy efficiency requirements; and, 

WHEREAS, the City of Downey is subject to ground tremors from large seismic 
events along, but not limited to, the San Andreas Fault; and, 

 
WHEREAS, the City of Downey desires to adopt the 2025 California Building 

Code (Incorporating and Amending the 2024 International Building Code) as set forth 
in California Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 2 – including Appendix H (Signs); 
together with the necessary amendments to assure the Code is tailored to the particular 
safety needs of the City as required by its unique climatic, geological, and/or 
topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, the Building Official has recommended that changes and 
modifications be made to the Code, and has advised that certain changes and 
modifications to the Code are reasonably necessary due to local climatic, geological, 
and/or topographical conditions within the City of Downey – each of which is 
substantially equivalent to previous modifications enacted by the City Council of the 
City of Downey that were filed with the California Building Standards Commission and 
were in effect as of September 30, 2025, and has further advised that the remainder 
of said changes and modifications are of an administrative or procedural nature, 
or concern themselves with subjects not covered by the Code, or are reasonably 
necessary to safeguard life and property within the City of Downey; 

WHEREAS, in accordance with California Government Code Section 36937(b) 
and Downey City Charter Sections 511 and 514, and based upon the recitals set forth 
herein, the City Council finds that the adoption of this Urgency Ordinance is necessary 
in order to preserve the immediate public peace, health, safety, and general welfare, 
as the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code becomes effective on January 1, 
2026 without consideration of the local amendments set forth herein; and, 

WHEREAS, notice of a public hearing on this Ordinance was published in the 
Downey Patriot, a newspaper of general circulation in the City, on January 1, 2026; 
and, 

 
WHEREAS, the City Council held a duly-noticed public meeting on January 13, 

2026, as required by law, at which time the Council determined that the adoption of 
the Code is in the best interest of the City and is based upon the express findings 
required by law; and, 

 
WHEREAS, at least one copy of the Code adopted by reference in this 

Ordinance was available for public inspection at the office of the City Clerk fifteen (15)  
 
days preceding the public hearing pursuant to Government Code Section 50022.6. 

 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 3 

 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DOWNEY DOES 
HEREBY ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS: 

 
SECTION 1: Findings. The City Council hereby finds that the proposed 

amendments to the 2025 California Building Code are reasonably necessary because 
of local climatic, geologic, or topographic conditions, and adopts the findings provided 
below to support the modifications to the 2025 California Building Code. The City 
Council also finds that the proposed amendments affecting residential units are 
substantially equivalent to previous modifications enacted by the City Council of the City 
of Downey that were filed with the California Building Standards Commission and were 
in effect as of September 30, 2025.  The City Council further finds that some changes 
and modifications are of an administrative or procedural nature, or concern themselves 
with subjects not covered by the code, or are reasonably necessary to safeguard life 
and property within the City. The City Council hereby adopts the following (Climatic, 
geological, and topographical, where applicable} findings to support the proposed 
amendments to the 2025 California Building Code made in this Ordinance: 

 
I. Climatic conditions 

 
A. The jurisdiction of the City of Downey (or, "City") is located in a semi-arid 

Mediterranean type climate. It annually experiences extended periods of 
high temperatures with little or no precipitation. For example, during July, 
August and September, temperatures often exceed 100 degrees 
Fahrenheit. During the same months humidity is usually less than 40%, 
and humidity measurements less than 10% are not uncommon. These 
conditions contribute to an increased likelihood of fire. Moreover, minor 
fires have a greater tendency of spreading rapidly due to such conditions. 
The City, being in the Southern California area, is also subject to 
"Sundowner" or "Santa Ana" winds that, should a fire occur, cause the 
fire to spread rapidly over wood shake roofs which are common in the 
residential areas. These hot, dry (Santa Ana) winds may reach speeds 
of 70 M.P.H. or greater. These climatic conditions cause extreme drying 
of vegetation and common building materials. Frequent periods of 
drought and low humidity add to the fire danger. This predisposes the 
area to large destructive fires (conflagration). In addition to directly 
damaging or destroying buildings, these fires are also prone to disrupt 
utility services throughout the City. Obstacles generated by a strong 
wind, such as fallen trees, street lights and utility poles, and the 
requirement to climb 75 feet vertically up flights of stairs will greatly 
impact the response time to reach an incident scene. Additionally, there 
is a significant increase in the amount of wind force at 60 feet above the 
ground. Use of aerial type fire-fighting apparatus above this height would 
place rescue personnel at increased risk of injury. 

 
B. Water demand in this densely populated area far exceeds the quantity 

supplied by natural precipitation; and although the population continues 
to grow, the already taxed water supply does not. California is 
projected to increase in population by nearly 10 million over the next 
quarter of a century with 50 percent of that growth centered in Southern 
California. Due to storage capacities and consumption, and a limited 
amount of rainfall, future water allocation is not fully dependable. This 
necessitates the need for additional and on-site fire protection features. 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 4 

It would also leave tall buildings vulnerable to uncontrolled fires due to 
a lack of available water and an inability to pump sufficient quantities of 
available water to floors in a fire. 

C. These dry climatic conditions and winds contribute to the rapid spread 
of even small fires originating in high-density housing or vegetation. 
These fires spread very quickly and create a need for increased levels 
of fire protection. The added protection of fire sprinkler systems and 
other fire protection features will supplement normal fire department 
response by providing immediate protection for the building occupants 
and by containing and controlling the fire spread to the area of origin. 
Fire sprinkler systems will also reduce the use of water for firefighting 
by as much as 50 to 75 percent. 

 
II. Topographical conditions 

 
A. Development has occurred in the City and continues to occur in the City 

and such development has resulted in severe traffic congestion during 
peak business hours, weekends and holidays, thus decreasing the 
response time of fire and emergency service vehicles, particularly on 
the following streets and highways: Florence Avenue, Firestone 
Boulevard, Imperial Highway, Paramount Boulevard, Lakewood 
Boulevard, Brookshire Avenue, Bellflower Boulevard. 

B. These topographical conditions combine to create a situation which 
places fire department response time to fire occurrences at risk, and 
makes it necessary to provide automatic on-site fire-extinguishing 
systems and other protection measures to protect occupants and 
property. Due to these topographical conditions and the expected 
infrastructure damage inherent in seismic zones described below, it is 
prudent to rely on automatic fire sprinkler systems to mitigate extended 
fire department response time and keep fires manageable with reduced 
fire flow (water) requirements for a given structure. Numerous fires have 
occurred within the City in residential structures (houses, apartments, 
hotels, motels, and dormitories) over the past several years that have 
automatic fire protection systems, and in all of these fires, the automatic 
fire protection systems have successfully controlled and/or suppressed 
the fire before the emergency response personnel have been able to 
arrive at the structure. Additional fire protection is also justified to match 
the current resources of firefighting equipment and personnel within the 
fire department. 

 
Ill. Geological Conditions 

A. The City of Downey is located in Southern California, in an extremely 
active seismic region, with high levels of historic earthquake shaking in 
the recent past (earthquakes measuring larger than a magnitude 5 on 
the Richter Scale) and can be expected to experience significant strong 
ground shaking within the foreseeable future. The City is a densely 
populated area that has buildings constructed over and near a vast and 
complex network of faults that increase the likelihood of catastrophic 
damage when a seismic event occurs and which are believed to be 
capable of producing future earthquakes similar or greater in size to the 
1994 Northridge, the 1987 Whittier Narrows Earthquake, the 1971 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 5 

Sylmar earthquakes and 1933 Long Beach Earthquake. 
 

B. The seismotectonic setting of the City is dominated by the Norwalk fault, 
which traverses the northern portion of the City. The City is also in close 
proximity to the San Andreas Fault, which is located 40 miles to the 
northeast, the Whittier fault, located 10 miles to the northeast and the 
Newport-Inglewood fault, located 10 miles to the southwest. In the 
event of a severe earthquake, these faults present the potential for 
catastrophic damage, including fire, damage to roadways and other 
impairments of emergency apparatus. Existing and planned 
developments are at risk from structural damage from earthquake faults. 
Improved standards are necessary to ensure that maximum safety is 
provided to persons and property. 

 
C. Previous earthquakes have been accompanied by disruption of traffic 

flow and fires. A severe seismic event has the potential to negatively 
impact any rescue or fire suppression activities because it is likely to 
create obstacles similar to those indicated under the high wind section 
above. This situation creates the need for both additional fire protection 
and automatic on-site fire protection for building occupants. 

 
 
 

[Continued on Next Page] 
 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 6 

 
IV. The findings above are applicable to the Amendments to the 2025 California Building Code as 

follows: 
 

 
2025 CBC Section 
Amended or Added 

 
TITLE/DESCRIPTION 

Findings 
(Administrative, 

I, II, Ill) 

1613.8 Add CBC Section 1613.8, "Amendments to ASCE 7" Ill 
1613.8.1 Add CBC Section 1613.8.1, "Values for vertical combinations" Ill 
1613.8.2 Add CBC Section 1613.8.2, "Wood Diaphragms" III 
1613.8.3 Add CBC Section 1613.8.3, "Structural Separation" Ill 
1613.9 Add CBC Section 1613.9, "Seismic Design Provisions for Hillside 

Buildings" Ill 
1613.10 Add CBC Section 1613.10, "Suspended Ceilings" Ill 
1704.6 Amend CBC Section 1704.6, "Structural Observations" Ill 

1704.6.1 Amend CBC Section 1704.6.1, "Structural Observations for Seismic 
Resistance" Ill 

1705.3 Amend CBC Section 1705.3, "Concrete Construction" Ill 
1705.13 Amend CBC Section 1705.13, "Special Inspections for Seismic 

Resistance" Ill 
1807.1.4 Amend CBC Section 1807.1.4, "Permanent Wood Foundation Systems" Ill 
1807.1.6 Amend CBC Section 1807.1.6, "Prescriptive Design of Concrete and 

Masonry Foundation Walls" Ill 
1807.2 Amend CBC Section 1807.2, "Retaining Walls" Ill 

1807.3.1 Amend CBC Section 1807.3.1, "limitations" Ill 
1809.3 Amend CBC Section 1809. 3, "Stepped Footings" Ill 

1809.7 and Table 
1809.7 

Amend CBC Section 1809.7, "Prescriptive Footings for light-Frame 
Construction," and Table 1809.7, "Prescriptive Footings Supporting 
Walls of light-Frame Construction" 

 
Ill 

1809.12 Amend CBC Section 1809.12, "Timber Footings" Ill 
1810.3.2.4 Amend CBC Section 1810.3.2.4, "Timber" Ill 
2304.10.2 Amend CBC Section 2304.10.2, "Fastener Requirements" Ill 

2304.10.3.1 Add CBC Section 2304.10.3.1, "Quality of Nails" Ill 
2304.12.2.8 Amend CBC Section 2304.12.2.8, "Wood Used in Retaining Walls and 

Cribs" 
Ill 

2305.4 Add CBC Section 2305.4, "Hold-down Connectors" Ill 
2306.2 Amend CBC Section 2306.2, "Wood-Frame Diaphragms" Ill 
2306.3 Amend CBC Section 2306.3, "Wood-Frame Shear Walls" Ill 
2307.2 Add CBC Section 2307.2, "Wood-Frame Shear Walls" 

Ill 
Table 2308.6.1 Amend CBC Table 2308.6.1, "Wall Bracing Requirements" Ill 
2308.6.5.1 and 

2308.6.5.2 
Amend CBC Sections 2308.6.5.1, "Alternate Braced Wall (ABW)," and 
2308.6.5.2, "Portal Frame with Hold-Downs (PFH)" 

Ill 

Figures 2308.6.5.1 
and 2308.6.5.2 

Amend Figures 2308.6.5.1, "Alternate Braced Wall Panel (ABW)," and 
2308.6.5.2, "Portal Frame with Hold-Downs (PFH)" 

 

2308.6.8.1 Amend CBC Section 2308.6.8.1, "Foundation Requirements" Ill 
2308.6.9 Amend CBC Section 2308.6.9, "Attachment of Sheathing" Ill 

3115 Amend CBC Section 3115, "lntermodal Shipping Containers" 
Ill 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 7 

 
SECTION 2: Chapter 1 ("Downey Building Code") of Article VIII ("Building Regulations") of the 

Downey Municipal Code is hereby repealed in its entirety and amended to read as follows: 
 
 

"CHAPTER 1 
DOWNEY BUILDING CODE 

 
§ 8000 - Adoption by Reference of California Building Code. Except as provided herein, the 
2025 Edition of the California Building Code, (California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 2), 
based upon the 2024 International Building Code, including Appendix H (Signs) is hereby adopted 
by reference as though fully set forth herein, and shall constitute and is hereby established as the 
"Downey Building Code." A copy of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code is on file in the 
Building and Safety Division and the Office of the City Clerk for use and examination by the public. 

 
§ 8001 - Sections 1613.8 and 1613.8.1 are added to Chapter 16 of the 2025 Edition of the 
California Building Code to read as follows: 

1613.5 Amendments to ASCE 7. The provisions of Section 1613.5 shall be permitted as an 
amendment to the relevant provisions of ASCE 7. 

 
1613.5.1 Values for vertical combinations. Modify ASCE 7 Section 12.2.3.1 Exception 3 as 
follows: 

3. Detached one- and two-family dwellings up to two stories in height of light frame 
construction. 

 
§ 8002 - Section 1613.8.2 is added to Chapter 16 of the 2025 Edition of the California Building 
Code to read as follows: 

 
1613.8.2 Wood diaphragms. Modify ASCE 7 Section 12.11.2.2.3 as follows: 

 
12.11.2.3 Wood diaphragms. The anchorage of concrete or masonry structural walls to 
wood diaphragms shall be in accordance with AWC SDPWS 4.1.5.1 and this section. 
Continuous ties required by this section shall be in addition to the diaphragm sheathing. 
Anchorage shall not be accomplished by use of toenails or nails subject to withdrawal, nor 
shall wood ledgers or framing be used in cross-grain bending or cross-grain tension. The 
diaphragm sheathing shall not be considered effective for providing the ties or struts 
required by this section 
 
For structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F, wood diaphragms 
supporting concrete or masonry walls shall comply with the following: 

 
1. The spacing of continuous ties shall not exceed 40 feet Added chords of 

diaphragms may be used to form subdiaphragms to transmit the anchorage forces 
to the main continuous crossties. 
 

2. The maximum diaphragm shear used to determine the depth of the subdiaphragm 
shall not exceed 75% of the maximum diaphragm shear. 





ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 9  

PRIMARY ANCHORS are diaphragm anchors designed for and providing a direct 
connection as described in Sections 1613.6.5 and 1613.6.7.3 between the diaphragm and 
the uphill foundation. 
 
SECONDARY ANCHORS are diaphragm anchors designed for and providing a 
redundant diaphragm to foundation connection, as described in Sections 1613.6.6 and 
1613.6.7.4. 

UPHILL DIAPHRAGM EDGE is the edge of the diaphragm adjacent and closest to the 
highest ground level at the perimeter of the diaphragm. 

UPHILL FOUNDATION is the foundation parallel and closest to the uphill diaphragm 
edge. 

 
1613.9.4 Analysis and design. 

1613.9.4.1 General. Every hillside building within the scope of this section shall be analyzed, 
designed, and constructed in accordance with the provisions of this division. When the code 
prescribed wind design produces greater effects, the wind design shall govern, but detailing 
requirements and limitations prescribed in this and referenced sections shall be followed. 

 
1613.9.4.2 Base level diaphragm-downhill direction. The following provisions shall 
apply to the seismic analysis and design of the connections for the base level diaphragm in 
the downhill direction. 

 
1613.9.4.2.1 Base for lateral force design defined. For seismic forces acting in the downhill 
direction, the base of the building shall be the floor at or closest to the top of the highest level 
of the foundation. 

1613.9.4.2.2 Base shear. In developing the base shear for seismic design, the response 
modification coefficient (R) shall not exceed 5 for bearing wall and building frame systems. 
The total base shear shall include the forces tributary to the base level diaphragm including 
forces from the base level diaphragm. 

 
1613.9.5 Base shear resistance-primary anchors. 

 
1613.9.5.1 General. The base shear in the downhill direction shall be resisted through primary 
anchors from diaphragm struts provided in the base level diaphragm to the foundation. 

 
1613.9.5.2 location of primary anchors. A primary anchor and diaphragm strut shall be 
provided in line with each foundation extending in the downhill direction. Primary anchors and 
diaphragm struts shall also be provided where interior vertical lateral-force-resisting elements 
occur above and in contact with the base level diaphragm. The spacing of primary anchors 
and diaphragm struts or collectors shall in no case exceed 30 feet (9144 mm). 

 
1613.9.5.3 Design of primary anchors and diaphragm struts. Primary anchors and 
diaphragm struts shall be designed in accordance with the requirements of Section 1613.6.8. 

 
1613.9.5.4 limitations. The following lateral-force-resisting elements shall not be designed 
to resist seismic forces below the base level diaphragm in the downhill direction: 

 
1. Wood structural panel wall sheathing, 
2. Cement plaster and lath, 
3. Gypsum wallboard, and 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 10  

4. Tension only braced frames. 

Braced frames designed in accordance with the requirements of Section 2205.2.1.2 may be 
used to transfer forces from the primary anchors and diaphragm struts to the foundation 
provided lateral forces do not induce flexural stresses in any member of the frame or in the 
diaphragm struts. Deflections of frames shall account for the variation in slope of diagonal 
members when the frame is not rectangular. 

 
1613.9.6 Base shear resistance-secondary anchors. 

 
1613.9.6.1 General. In addition to the primary anchors required by Section 1613.6.5, the base 
shear in the downhill direction shall be resisted through secondary anchors in the uphill 
foundation connected to diaphragm struts in the base level diaphragm. 

 
Exception: Secondary anchors are not required where foundations extending in the downhill 
direction spaced at not more than 30 feet (9144 mm) on center extend up to and are directly 
connected to the base level diaphragm for at least 70% of the diaphragm depth. 

 
1613.9.6.2 Secondary anchor capacity and spacing. Secondary anchors at the base level 
diaphragm shall be designed for a minimum force equal to the base shear, including forces 
tributary to the base level diaphragm, but not less than 600 pounds per lineal foot (8.76 kN/m) 
based on Allowable Stress Design (ASD) levels. The secondary anchors shall be uniformly 
distributed along the uphill diaphragm edge and shall be spaced a maximum of 4 feet (1219 
mm) on center. 

 
1613.9.6.3 Design. Secondary anchors and diaphragm struts shall be designed in accordance 
with Section 1613.6.8. 

 
1613.9.7 Diaphragms below the base level-downhill direction. The following provisions 
shall apply to the lateral analysis and design of the connections for all diaphragms below the 
base level diaphragm in the downhill direction. 

 
1613.9.7.1 Diaphragm defined. Every floor level below the base level diaphragm shall be 
designed as a diaphragm. 

 
1613.9.7.2 Design force. Each diaphragm below the base level diaphragm shall be designed 
for all tributary loads at that level using a minimum seismic force factor not less than the base 
shear coefficient. 

 
1613.9.7.3 Design force resistance-primary anchors. The design force described in Section 
1613.6.7.2 shall be resisted through primary anchors from diaphragm struts provided in each 
diaphragm to the foundation. Primary anchors shall be provided and designed in accordance 
with the requirements and limitations of Section 1613.6.5. 

1613.9.7.4 Design force resistance-secondary anchors. 
 

1613.9.7.4.1 General. In addition to the primary anchors required in Section 1613.6.7.3, the 
design force in the downhill direction shall be resisted through secondary anchors in the uphill 
foundation connected to diaphragm struts in each diaphragm below the base level. 

  



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 11  

 

Exception: Secondary anchors are not required where foundations extending in the downhill 
direction, spaced at not more than 30 feet (9144 mm) on center, extend up to and are directly 
connected to each diaphragm below the base level for at least 70% of the diaphragm depth. 

 
1613.9.7.4.2 Secondary anchor capacity. Secondary anchors at each diaphragm below the 
base level diaphragm shall be designed for a minimum force equal to the design force but not 
less than 300 pounds per lineal foot (4.38 kN/m) based on Allowable Stress Design (ASD) 
levels. The secondary anchors shall be uniformly distributed along the uphill diaphragm edge 
and shall be spaced a maximum of 4 feet (1219 mm) on center. 

 
1613.9.7.4.3 Design. Secondary anchors and diaphragm struts shall be designed in 
accordance with Section 1613.6.8. 

 
1613.9.8 Primary and secondary anchorage and diaphragm strut design. Primary 
and secondary anchors and diaphragm struts shall be designed in accordance with the 
following provisions: 

 
1. Fasteners. All bolted fasteners used to develop connections to wood members shall be 

provided with square plate washers at all bolt heads and nuts. Washers shall be minimum 
0.229 inch by 3 inches by 3 inches (5.82 mm by 76 mm by 76 mm) in size. Nuts shall be 
tightened to finger tight plus one half (1/2) wrench tum prior to covering the framing. 

 
2. Fastening. The diaphragm to foundation anchorage shall not be accomplished by the use 

of toenailing, nails subject to withdrawal, or wood in cross-grain bending or cross-grain 
tension. 

 
3. Size of Wood Members. Wood diaphragm struts collectors, and other wood members 

connected to primary anchors shall not be less than 3 inch (76 mm) nominal width. The 
effects of eccentricity on wood members shall be evaluated as required per Item 9. 

4. Design. Primary and secondary anchorage, including diaphragm struts, splices, and 
collectors shall be designed for 125% of the tributary force. 

 
5. Allowable Stress Increase. The one-third allowable stress increase permitted under 

Section 1605.3.2 shall not be taken when the working (allowable) stress design method is 
used. 

 
6. Steel Element of Structural Wall Anchorage System. The strength design forces for steel 

elements of the structural wall anchorage system, with the exception of anchor bolts and 
reinforcing steel, shall be increased by 1.4 times the forces otherwise required. 

 
7. Primary Anchors. The load path for primary anchors and diaphragm struts shall be fully 

developed into the diaphragm and into the foundation. The foundation must be shown to 
be adequate to resist the concentrated loads from the primary anchors. 

 
8. Secondary Anchors. The load path for secondary anchors and diaphragm struts shall be 

fully developed in the diaphragm but need not be developed beyond the connection to the 
foundation. 

 
9. Symmetry. All lateral force foundation anchorage and diaphragm strut connections shall 

be symmetrical. Eccentric connections may be permitted when demonstrated by 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 12  

calculation or tests that all components of force have been provided for in the structural 
analysis or tests. 

 
10. Wood Ledgers. Wood ledgers shall not be used to resist cross-grain bending or cross 

grain tension. 
 

1613.9.9 Lateral-force-resisting elements normal to the downhill direction. 
 

1613.9.9.1 General. In the direction normal to the downhill direction, lateral-force-resisting 
elements shall be designed in accordance with the requirements of this section. 

 
1613.9.9.2 Base shear. In developing the base shear for seismic design, the response 
modification coefficient (R) shall not exceed 5 for bearing wall and building frame systems. 

 
1613.9.9.3 Vertical distribution of seismic forces. For seismic forces acting normal to the 
downhill direction the distribution of seismic forces over the height of the building using Section 
12.8.3 of ASCE 7 shall be determined using the height measured from the top of the lowest 
level of the building foundation. 

 
1613.9.9.4 Drift limitations. The story drift below the base level diaphragm shall not exceed 
0.007 times the story height at strength design force level. The total drift from the base level 
diaphragm to the top of the foundation shall not exceed 3/4 inch (19 mm). Where the story 
height or the height from the base level diaphragm to the top of the foundation varies because 
of a stepped footing or story offset, the height shall be measured from the average height of 
the top of the foundation. The story drift shall not be reduced by the effect of horizontal 
diaphragm stiffness. 

 
1613.9.9.5 Distribution of lateral forces. 

 
1613.9.9.5.1 General. The design lateral force shall be distributed to lateral-force-resisting 
elements of varying heights in accordance with the stiffness of each individual element. 

 
1613.9.9.5.2 Wood structural panel sheathed walls. The stiffness of a stepped wood 
structural panel shear wall may be determined by dividing the wall into adjacent rectangular 
elements, subject to the same top of wall deflection. Deflections of shear walls may be 
estimated by AWC SDPWS Section 4.3.2. Sheathing and fastening requirements for the 
stiffest section shall be used for the entire wall. Each section of wall shall be anchored for shear 
and uplift at each step. The minimum horizontal length of a step shall be 8 feet (2438 mm) and 
the maximum vertical height of a step shall be 2 feet 8 inches (813 mm). 

 
1613.9.9.5.3 Reinforced concrete or masonry shear walls. Reinforced concrete or masonry 
shear walls shall have forces distributed in proportion to the rigidity of each section of the wall. 

 
1613.9.9.6 limitations. The following lateral force-resisting-elements shall not be designed to 
resist lateral forces below the base level diaphragm in the direction normal to the downhill 
direction: 

 
1. Cement plaster and lath, 
2. Gypsum wallboard, and 
3. Tension-only braced frames. 

  



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 13  

Braced frames designed in accordance with the requirements of Section 2205.2.1.2 of this 
Code may be designed as lateral-force-resisting elements in the direction normal to the 
downhill direction, provided lateral forces do not induce flexural stresses in any member of the 
frame. Deflections of frames shall account for the variation in slope of diagonal members when 
the frame is not rectangular. 

1613.9.10 Specific design provisions. 
 
1613.9.10.1 Footings and grade beams. All footings and grade beams shall comply with the 
following: 

 
1. Grade beams shall extend at least 12 inches (305 mm) below the lowest adjacent grade 

and provide a minimum 24 inch (610 mm) distance horizontally from the bottom outside 
face of the grade beam to the face of the descending slope. 

 
2. Continuous footings shall be reinforced with at least two No. 4 reinforcing bars at the top 

and two No. 4 reinforcing bars at the bottom. 
 

3. All main footing and grade beam reinforcement steel shall be bent into the intersecting 
footing and fully developed around each corner and intersection. 

 
4. All concrete stem walls shall extend from the foundation and reinforced as required for 

concrete or masonry walls. 
 

1613.9.10.2 Protection against decay and termites. All wood to earth separation shall 
comply with the following: 

 
1. Where a footing or grade beam extends across a descending slope, the stem wall, grade 

beam, or footing shall extend up to a minimum 18 inches (457 mm) above the highest 
adjacent grade. 

 
Exception: At paved garage and doorway entrances to the building, the stem wall need 
only extend to the finished concrete slab, provided the wood framing is protected with a 
moisture proof barrier. 

 
2. Wood ledgers supporting a vertical load of more than 100 pounds per lineal foot (1.46 

kN/m) based on Allowable Stress Design (ASD) levels and located within 48 inches (1219 
mm) of adjacent grade are prohibited. Galvanized steel ledgers and anchor bolts, with or 
without wood nailers, or treated or decay resistant sill plates supported on a concrete or 
masonry seat, may be used. 

1613.9.10.3 Sill plates. All sill plates and anchorage shall comply with the following: 

1. All wood framed walls, including nonbearing walls, when resting on a footing, foundation, 
or grade beam stem wall, shall be supported on wood sill plates bearing on a level surface. 

 
2. Power-driven fasteners shall not be used to anchor sill plates except at interior nonbearing 

walls not designed as shear walls. 
 

1613.9.10.4 Column base plate anchorage. The base of isolated wood posts (not framed into 
a stud wall) supporting a vertical load of 4,000 pounds (17.8 kN) based on Allowable Stress 
Design (ASD) levels or more and the base plate for a steel column shall comply with the 
following: 

 
1. When the post or column is supported on a pedestal extending above the top of a footing 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 14  

or grade beam, the pedestal shall be designed and reinforced as required for concrete or 
masonry columns. The pedestal shall be reinforced with a minimum of four No. 4 bars 
extending to the bottom of the footing or grade beam. The top of exterior pedestals shall 
be sloped for positive drainage. 

 
2. The base plate anchor bolts or the embedded portion of the post base, and the vertical 

reinforcing bars for the pedestal, shall be confined with two No. 4 or three No. 3 ties within 
the top 5 inches (127 mm) of the concrete or masonry pedestal. The base plate anchor 
bolts shall be embedded a minimum of 20 bolt diameters into the concrete or masonry 
pedestal. The base plate anchor bolts and post bases shall be galvanized and each anchor 
bolt shall have at least 2 galvanized nuts above the base plate. 

1613.9.10.5 Steel beam to column supports. All steel beam to column supports shall be 
positively braced in each direction. Steel beams shall have stiffener plates installed on each 
side of the beam web at the column. The stiffener plates shall be welded to each beam flange 
and the beam web. Each brace connection or structural member shall consist of at least two 
5/8 inch (15.9 mm) diameter machine bolts. 

 
§ 8005 - Section 1613.10is added to Chapter 16 of the 2025 Edition of the California Building 
Code to read as follows: 

 
1613.10 Suspended ceilings. Minimum design and installation standards for suspended 
ceilings shall be determined in accordance with the requirements of Section 2506.2.1 of this 
Code and this section. 

1613.10.1 Scope. This part contains special requirements for suspended ceilings and lighting 
systems. Provisions of Section 13.5.6 of ASCE 7 shall apply except as modified herein. 

 
1613.10.2 General. The suspended ceilings and lighting systems shall be limited to 6 feet 
(1828 mm) below the structural deck unless the lateral bracing is designed by a licensed 
engineer or architect. 

1613.10.3 Sprinkler heads. All sprinkler heads (drops) except fire-resistance-rated 
floor/ceiling or roof/ceiling assemblies, shall be designed to allow for free movement of the 
sprinkler pipes with oversize rings, sleeves or adaptors through the ceiling tile. Sprinkler heads 
and other penetrations shall have a 2 inch (50mm) oversize ring, sleeve, or adapter through 
the ceiling tile to allow for free movement of at least 1 inch (25mm) in all horizontal directions. 
Alternatively, a swing joint that can accommodate 1 inch (25 mm) of ceiling movement in all 
horizontal directions is permitted to be provided at the top of the sprinkler head extension. 

 
Sprinkler heads penetrating fire-resistance-rated floor/ceiling or roof/ceiling assemblies shall 
comply with Section 714 of this Code. 

 
1613.10.4 Special requirements for means of egress. Suspended ceiling assemblies located 
along means of egress serving an occupant load of 30 or more and at lobbies accessory to 
Group A Occupancies shall comply with the following provisions. 

1613.10.4.1 General. Ceiling suspension systems shall be connected and braced with vertical 
hangers attached directly to the structural deck along the means of egress serving an occupant 
load of 30 or more and at lobbies' accessory to Group A Occupancies. Spacing of vertical 
hangers shall not exceed 2 feet (610 mm) on center along the entire length of the suspended 
ceiling assembly located along the means of egress or at the lobby. 

 
 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 15  
 

1613.10.4.2 Assembly device. All lay-in panels shall be secured to the suspension ceiling 
assembly with two hold-down clips minimum for each tile within a 4-foot (1219 mm) radius of 
the exit lights and exit signs. 
 
1613.10.4.3 Emergency systems. Independent supports and braces shall be provided for light 
fixtures required for exit illumination. Power supply for exit illumination shall comply with the 
requirements of Section 1008.3 of this Code. 

 
1613.10.4.4 Supports for appendage. Separate support from the structural deck shall be 
provided for all appendages such as light fixtures, air diffusers, exit signs, and similar elements. 

 
§ 8006 - Section 1704.6 of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read 
as follows: 

1704.6 Structural observations. Where required by the provisions of Section 1704.6.1, the 
owner or the owner's authorized agent shall employ a structural observer to perform structural 
observations. The structural observer shall visually observe representative locations of 
structural systems, details and load paths for general conformance to the approved 
construction documents. Structural observation does not include or waive the responsibility for 
the inspections in Section 110 or the special inspections in Section 1705 or other sections of 
this code. The structural observer shall be one of the following individuals: 

 
1. The registered design professional responsible for the structural design, or 

 
2. A registered design professional designated by the registered design professional 

responsible for the structural design. 
 

Prior to the commencement of observations, the structural observer shall submit to the building 
official a written statement identifying the frequency and extent of structural observations. 

 
The owner or owner's authorized agent shall coordinate and call a preconstruction meeting 
between the structural observer, contractors, affected subcontractors and special inspectors. 
The structural observer shall preside over the meeting. The purpose of the meeting shall be to 
identify the major structural elements and connections that affect the vertical and lateral load 
resisting systems of the structure and to review scheduling of the required observations. A 
record of the meeting shall be included in the report submitted to the building official. 

 
Observed deficiencies shall be reported in writing to the owner or owner's authorized agent, 
special inspector, contractor and the building official. Upon the form prescribed by the building 
official, the structural observer shall submit to the building official a written statement at each 
significant construction stage stating that the site visits have been made and identifying any 
reported deficiencies which, to the best of the structural observer's knowledge, have not been 
resolved. A final report by the structural observer which states that all observed deficiencies 
have been resolved is required before acceptance of the work by the building official. 

 
  



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 16  

 
§ 8007- Section 1704.6.1 of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read 
as follows: 

 
1704.6.1 Structural observations for seismic resistance. Structural observations shall be 
provided for those structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E, or F where one or 
more of the following conditions exist: 

1. The structure is classified as Risk Category Ill or IV. 

2. The structure is a high-rise building. 
 

3. A lateral design is required for the structure or portion thereof. 

Exception: One-story wood framed Group R-3 and Group U Occupancies less 
than 2,000 square feet in area, provided the adjacent grade is not steeper than 
1 unit vertical in 10 units horizontal (10% sloped), assigned to Seismic Design 
Category D. 

4. Such observation is required by the registered design professional responsible for 
the structural design. 

5. Such observation is specifically required by the building official. 

§ 8008 - Section 1705.3 of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read as 
follows: 

1705.3 Concrete construction. Special inspections and tests of concrete construction shall 
be performed in accordance with this section and Table 1705.3. 

Exceptions: Special inspections and tests shall not be required for: 

1. Isolated spread concrete footings of buildings three stories or less above grade plane 
that are fully supported on earth or rock where the structural design of the footing is 
based on a specified compressive strength (f'c) not more than 2,500 pounds per square 
inch (psi) (17.2 Mpa) regardless of the compressive strength specified in the 
construction documents or used in the footing construction. 

 
2. Continuous concrete footings supporting walls of buildings three stories or less above 

grade plane that are fully supported on earth or rock where: 

2.1. The footings support walls of light-frame construction; 

2.2. The footings are designed in accordance with Table 1809.7; or 

2.3. The structural design of the footing is based on a specified compressive 
strength, f'c, not more than 2,500 pounds per square inch (psi) (17.2 MPa), 
regardless of the compressive strength specified in the construction 
documents or used in the footing construction. 

3. Nonstructural concrete slabs supported directly on the ground, including prestressed 
slabs on grade, where the effective prestress in the concrete is less than 150 psi (1.03 
MPa). 

4. Concrete patios, driveways and sidewalks, on grade 
  



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 17  

 

§ 8009 - Section 1705.13 of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read 
as follows: 

1705.13 Special inspections for seismic resistance. Special inspections for seismic 
resistance shall be required as specified in Sections 1705.13.1 through 1705.13.9, unless 
exempted by the exceptions of Section 1704.2. 

 
Exception: The special inspections specified in Sections 1705.13.1 through 1705.13.9 are not 
required for structures designed and constructed in accordance with one of the following: 
 
1. The structure consists of light-frame construction; the design spectral response 

acceleration at short periods, Sos, as determined in Section 1613.2.4, does not exceed 
0.5; and the building height of the structure does not exceed 35 feet (10 668 mm). 

 
2. The seismic force-resisting system of the structure consists of reinforced masonry or 

reinforced concrete; the design spectral response acceleration at short periods, Sos, as 
determined in Section 1613.2.4, does not exceed 0.5; and the building height of the 
structure does not exceed 25 feet (7620 mm) 

 
3. The structure is a detached one- or two-family dwelling not exceeding two stories above 

grade plane, is not assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E, or F, and does not have 
any of the following horizontal or vertical irregularities in accordance with Section 12.3 of 
ASCE 7: 

 
3.1 Torsional or extreme torsional irregularity. 

 
3.2 Nonparallel systems irregularity. 

 
3.3 Stiffness-soft story or stiffness-extreme soft story irregularity. 

3.4 Discontinuity in lateral strength-weak story irregularity. 

§ 8010 - Section 1807.1.4 of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read 
as follows: 

 
1807.1.4 Permanent wood foundation systems. Permanent wood foundation systems shall 
be designed and installed in accordance with AWC PWF. Lumber and plywood shall be treated 
in accordance with AWPA U1 (Commodity Specification A, Special Requirement 4.2) and shall 
be identified in accordance with Section 2303.1.9.1. Permanent wood foundation systems shall 
not be used for structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E, or F. 

 
§ 8011 - Section 1807.1.6 of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read 
as follows: 

 
1807.1.6 Prescriptive design of concrete and masonry foundation walls. Concrete and 
masonry foundation walls that are laterally supported at the top and bottom shall be permitted 
to be designed and constructed in accordance with this section. Prescriptive design of 
foundation walls shall not be used for structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E, 
or F. 

 
  



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 18  

 
§ 8012 - Section 1807.2 of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read as 
follows: 

 
1807.2 Retaining walls. Retaining walls shall be designed in accordance with Section 
1807.2.1 through 1807.2.3. Retaining walls assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E, or F 
shall not be partially or wholly constructed of wood. 

 
§ 8013 – Section 1807.3.1 of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read 
as follows: 
 

1807.J.1 limitations. The design procedures outlined in this section are subject to the 
following limitations: 
 

1. The frictional resistance for structural walls and slabs on silts and clays shall be limited 
to one-half of the normal force imposed on the soils by the weight of the fooling or slab. 

2. Posts embedded in earth shall not be used to provide lateral support for structural or 
nonstructural materials such as plaster, masonry or concrete unless bracing is 
provided that develops the limited deflection required. 

Wood poles shall be treated in accordance with AWPA U1 for sawn timber posts (Commodity 
Specification A, Use Category 48) and for round timber posts (Commodity Specification B, Use 
Category 48). Wood poles and posts embedded in direct contact with soil shall not be used for 
structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E, or F. 

Exception: Wood poles and posts embedded in direct contact with soil may be used to support 
non-habitable, non-occupiable structures, such as fences, when approved by the building 
official. 

§ 8014 - Section 1809.3 of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read 
as follows: 

1809.3 Stepped footings. The top surface of footings shall be level. The bottom surface of 
footings shall be permitted to have a slope not exceeding 1 unit vertical in 10 units horizontal 
(10-percent slope). Footings shall be stepped where it is necessary to change the elevation 
of the top surface of the footing or where the surface of the ground slopes more than 1 unit 
vertical in 10 units horizontal (10-percent slope). 

 
For structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E, or F, the stepping requirement shall 
also apply to the top surface of continuous footings supporting walls. Footings shall be 
reinforced with four No. 4 deformed reinforcing bars. Two bars shall be placed at the top and 
bottom of the footings as shown in Figure 1809.3. 

 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 19  

 
FIGURE 1809.3 

STEPPED FOOTING 
 
 

 
§ 8015 - Section 1809.7 and Table 1809.7 of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code are 
amended to read as follows: 
 

1809.7 Prescriptive footings for light-frame construction. Where a specific design is not 
provided, concrete or masonry-unit footings supporting walls of light-frame construction shall 
be permitted to be designed in accordance with Table 1809.7. Light-frame construction using 
prescriptive footings in Table 1809.7 shall not exceed one story above grade plane for 
structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E, or F. 

TABLE 1809.7 
PRESCRIPTIVE FOOTINGS SUPPORTING WALLS OF 

LIGHT-FRAME CONSTRUCTION a, b, c, d, e 

NUMBER OF FLOORS SUPPORTED 
BY THE FOOTINGf 

WIDTH OF FOOTING 
(inches) 

THICKNESS OF 
FOOTING (inches) 

1 12 6 
2 15 6 
3 18 8g 

 
For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foot= 304.8 mm 
a. Depth of footings shall be in accordance with Section 1809.4. 
b. The ground under the floor shall be permitted to be excavated lo the elevation of the lop of the footing. 
c. See Section 1905 for additional requirements for concrete footings of structures assigned to Seismic Design Category C, 

D, E or F. 
d. For thickness of foundation walls, see Section 1807.1.6 
e. Footings shall be permitted to support a roof addition to the stipulated number of floors. Footings supporting roof only 

shall be as required for supporting one floor. 

 

§ 8016 - Section 1809.12 of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read as 
follows: 

 
1809.12 Timber footings. Timber footings shall be permitted for buildings of Type V 
construction and as otherwise approved by the Building Official. Such footings shall be treated 
in accordance with AWPA U1 (Commodity Specification A, Use Category 4B). Treated timbers 
are not required where placed entirely below permanent water level, or where used as capping 
for wood piles that project above the water level over submerged or marsh lands. The 
compressive stresses perpendicular to grain in untreated timber footings supported on treated 
piles shall not exceed 70 percent of the allowable stresses for the species and grade of timber  



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 20  

 
as specified in the ANSI/AWC NOS. Timber footings shall not be used in structures assigned 
to Seismic Design Category D, E, or F. 

 
§ 8017 - Section 1810.3.2.4 of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code is amended 
to read as follows: 

 
1810.3.2.4 Timber. Timber deep foundation elements shall be designed as piles or poles in 
accordance with ANSI/AWC NOS. Round timber elements shall conform to ASTM D 25. Sawn 
timber elements shall conform to DOC PS-20. Timber deep foundation elements shall not be 
used in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E, or F. 

 
§ 8018 - RESERVED 

 
§ 8019 - RESERVED 

 
§ 8020 - Section 2304.10.2 of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code is amended 
to read as follows: 

 
2304.10.2 Fastener requirements. Connections for wood members shall be designed in 
accordance with the appropriate methodology in Section 2302.1. The number and size of 
fasteners connecting wood members shall not be less than that set forth in Table 2304.10.2. 
Staple fasteners in Table 2304.10.2 shall not be used to resist or transfer seismic forces in 
structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E, or F. 

 
Exception: Staples may be used to resist or transfer seismic forces when the allowable shear 
values are substantiated by cyclic testing and approved by the building official. 

 
§ 8021 - Section 2304.10.3.1 is added to Chapter 23 of the 2025 Edition of the California Building 
Code to read as follows: 

 
2304.10.3.1 Quality of nails. In Seismic Design Category D, E, or F, mechanically driven nails 
used in wood structural panel shear walls shall meet the same dimensions as that required for 
hand-driven nails, including diameter, minimum length and minimum head diameter. Clipped 
head or box nails are not permitted in new construction. The allowable design value for clipped 
head nails in existing construction may be taken at no more than the nail-head-area ratio of 
that of the same size hand-driven nails. 

 
§ 8022 - Section 2304.12.2.8 of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code is amended 
to read as follows: 

 
2304.12.2.8 Wood used in retaining walls and cribs. Wood installed in retaining or crib 
walls shall be preservative treated in accordance with AWPA U1 for soil and fresh water use. 
Wood shall not be used in retaining or crib walls for structures assigned to Seismic Design 
Category D, E, or F. 

 
§ 8023 - Section 2305.4 is added to Chapter 23 of the 2025 Edition of the California Building 
Code to read as follows: 

 
2305.4 Hold-down connectors. In Seismic Design Category D, E, or F, hold-down 
connectors shall be designed to resist shear wall overturning moments using approved 
cyclic load values or 75 percent of the allowable seismic load values that do not consider 
cyclic loading of the product. Connector bolts into wood framing shall require steel plate 
washers on the post on the opposite side of the anchorage device. Plate size shall be a  



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 21  

 
minimum of 0.229 inch by 3 inches by 3 inches (5.82 mm by 76 mm by 76 mm) in size. 
Hold-down connectors shall be tightened to finger tight plus one half (1/2) wrench turn just 
prior to covering the wall framing. 

 
§ 8024 - Section 2306.2 of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read 
as follows: 

 
2306.2 Wood-frame diaphragms. Wood-frame diaphragms shall be designed and 
constructed in accordance with AWC SDPWS. Where panels are fastened to framing members 
with staples, requirements and limitations of AWC SDPWS shall be met and the allowable 
shear values set forth in Table 2306.2(1) or 2306.2(2) shall only be permitted for structures 
assigned to Seismic Design Category A, B, or C. 

 
Exception: Allowable shear values where panels are fastened to framing members with 
staples may be used if such values are substantiated by cyclic testing and approved by 
the building official. 

 
The allowable shear values in Tables 2306.2(1) and 2306.2(2) are permitted to be increased 
40 percent for wind design. 

 
Wood structural panel diaphragms used to resist seismic forces in structures assigned to 
Seismic Design Category D, E, or F shall be applied directly to the framing members. 

 
Exception: Wood structural panel diaphragms are permitted to be fastened over solid 
lumber planking or laminated decking, provided the panel joints and lumber planking or 
laminated decking joints do not coincide. 

 
§ 8025 - Section 2306.3 of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read 
as follows: 

 
2306.3 Wood-frame shear walls. Wood-frame shear walls shall be designed and constructed 
in accordance with AWC SDPWS. For structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E, 
or F, application of Tables 4.3A and 4.38 of ANSI/AWC SDPWS shall include the following: 

1. Wood structural panel thickness for shear walls shall not be less than 3/8 inch thick and 
studs shall not be spaced at more than 16 inches on center. 

 
2. The maximum nominal unit shear capacities for 3/8 inch wood structural panels resisting 

seismic forces in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E, or Fis 400 pounds 
per linear foot (plf). 

 
Exception: Other nominal unit shear capacities may be permitted if such values are 
substantiated by cyclic testing and approved by the building official. 

 
3. Nails shall be placed not less than 1/2 inch in from the panel edges and not less than 3/8 

inch from the edge of the connecting members for shear greater than 350 plf using ASD or 
500 plf using LRFD. Nails shall be placed not less than 3/8 inch from panel edges and not 
less than 1/4 inch from the edge of the connecting members for shears of 350 plf or less 
using ASD or 500 plf or less using LRFD. 

For structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E, or F, application of Table 4.38 of 
ANSI/AWC SDPWS shall not be allowed. 

 
For structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E, or F, application of Table 4.3C of  



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 22  

 
ANSI/AWC SDPWS shall not be used below the top level in a multi-level building. 

 
Where panels are fastened to framing members with staples, requirements and limitations of 
AWC SDPWS shall be met and the allowable shear values set forth in Table 2306.3(1), 
2306.3(2) or 2306.3(3) shall only be permitted for structures assigned to Seismic Design 
Category A, B, or C. 
 

Exception: Allowable shear values where panels are fastened to framing members 
with staples may be used if such values are substantiated by cyclic testing and 
approved by the building official. 

 
The allowable shear values in Tables 2306.3(1) and 2306.3(2) are permitted to be 
increased 40 percent for wind design. Panels complying with ANSI/APA PRP-210 shall be 
permitted to use design values for Plywood Siding in the ANSI/AWC SDPWS. 

 
§ 8026 - Section 2307.2 is added to the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code to read 
as follows: 

 
2307.2 Wood-frame shear walls. Wood-frame shear walls shall be designed and 
constructed in accordance with Section 2306.3 as applicable. 

 
 
 

[Continued on Next Page]



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 23  

Table 2308.6.1 of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read as follows: 
  
 
 
 
 

I 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 24  

 
§ 8027 - Sections 2308.10.5.1 and 2308.10.5.2 and Figures 2308.10.5.1 and 2308.10.5.2 of 
the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code are amended to read as follows: 

 
2308.10.5.1 Alternate braced wall (ABW). An ABW shall be constructed in accordance 
with this section and Figure 2308.6.5.1. In one-story buildings, each panel shall have a 
length of not less than 2 feet 8 inches (813 mm) and a height of not more than 10 feet (3048 
mm). Each panel shall be sheathed on one face with 3/8-inch (3.2 mm) minimum-
thickness wood structural panel sheathing nailed with 8d common or galvanized box nails 
in accordance with Table 2304.10.1 and blocked at wood structural panel edges. For 
structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D or E, each panel shall be sheathed on 
one face with 15/32-inch minimum-thickness (11.9 mm) wood structural panel sheathing 
nailed with 8d common nails spaced 3 inches on panel edges, 3 inches at intermediate 
supports. Two anchor bolts installed in accordance with Section 2308.3.1 shall be provided 
in each panel. Anchor bolts shall be placed at each panel outside quarter points. Each 
panel end stud shall have a hold-down device fastened to the foundation, capable of 
providing an approved uplift capacity of not less than 1,800 pounds (8006 N). The hold-
down device shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer's recommendations. 
The ABW shall be supported directly on a foundation or on floor framing supported directly 
on a foundation that is continuous across the entire length of the braced wall line. This 
foundation shall be reinforced with not less than one No. 4 bar top and bottom. Where the 
continuous foundation is required to have a depth greater than 12 inches (305 mm), a 
minimum 12-inch by 12-inch (305 mm by 305 mm) continuous footing is permitted at door 
openings in the braced wall line. This continuous footing shall be reinforced with not less 
than one No. 4 bar top and bottom. This reinforcement shall be lapped 24 inches (610 mm) 
with the reinforcement required in the continuous foundation located directly under the 
braced wall line. 

 
Where the ABW is installed at the first story of two-story buildings, the wood structural 
panel sheathing shall be provided on both faces, three anchor bolts shall be placed at 
one-quarter points and tie-down device uplift capacity shall be not less than 3,000 pounds 
(13,344 N). 
 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 
 
 

FIGURE 2308.10.5.1 
ALTERNATE BRACED WALL PANEL (ABW) 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 25  
 

2308.10.5.2 Portal frame with hold-downs (PFH). A PFH shall be constructed in 
accordance with this section and Figure 2308.6.5.2. The adjacent door or window opening 
shall have a full-length header. 

 
In one-story buildings, each panel shall have a length of not less than 16 inches (406 mm) and 
a height of not more than 10 feet (3048 mm). Each panel shall be sheathed on one face with 
a single layer of 3/8-inch (9.5 mm) minimum-thickness wood structural panel sheathing nailed 
with 8d common or galvanized box nails in accordance with Figure 2308.6.5.2. For structures 
assigned to Seismic Design Category D or E, each panel shall be sheathed on one face with 
15/32-inch-minimum-thickness (11.9 mm) wood structural panel sheathing nailed with 8d 
common nails spaced 3 inches on panel edges, 3 inches at intermediate supports and in 
accordance with Figure 2308.6.5.2. The wood structural panel sheathing shall extend up over 
the solid sawn or glued-laminated header and shall be nailed in accordance with Figure 
2308.6.5.2. A built-up header consisting of at least two 2-inch by 12-inch (51 mm by 305 mm) 
boards, fastened in accordance with Item 24 of Table 2304.10.1 shall be permitted to be used. 
A spacer, if used, shall be placed on the side of the built-up beam opposite the wood structural 
panel sheathing. The header shall extend between the inside faces of the first full-length outer 
studs of each panel. The clear span of the header between the inner studs of each panel shall 
be not less than 6 feet (1,829 mm) and not more than 18 feet (5,486 mm) in length. A strap 
with an uplift capacity of not less than 1,000 pounds (4,400 N) shall fasten the header to the 
inner studs opposite the sheathing. One anchor bolt not less than 5/8 inch (15.9 mm) diameter 
and installed in accordance with Section 2308.3.1 shall be provided in the center of each sill 
plate. The studs at each end of the panel shall have a hold-down device fastened to the 
foundation with an uplift capacity of not less than 3,500 pounds (15,570 N). 

 
Where a panel is located on one side of the opening, the header shall extend between the 
inside face of the first full-length stud of the panel and the bearing studs at the other end of the 
opening. A strap with an uplift capacity of not less than 1,000 pounds (4,400 N) shall fasten the 
header to the bearing studs. The bearing studs shall also have a hold-down device fastened 
to the foundation with an uplift capacity of not less than 1,000 pounds (4,400 N). The hold-down 
devices shall be an embedded strap type, installed in accordance with the manufacturer's 
recommendations. The PFH panels shall be supported directly on a foundation that is 
continuous across the entire length of the braced wall line. This foundation shall be reinforced 
with not less than one No. 4 bar top and bottom. Where the continuous foundation is required 
to have a depth greater than 12 inches (305 mm), a minimum 12-inch by 12-inch (305 mm by 
305 mm) continuous footing is permitted at door openings in the braced wall line. This 
continuous footing shall be reinforced with not less than one No. 4 bar top and bottom. This 
reinforcement shall be lapped not less than 24 inches (610 mm) with the reinforcement required 
in the continuous foundation located directly under the braced wall line. 

Where a PFH is installed at the first story of two-story buildings, each panel shall have a length 
of not less than 24 inches (610 mm). 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 26  
 
 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
FIGURE 2308.10.5.2 

PORTAL FRAME WITH HOLD-DOWNS (PFH) 

 

 
§ 8028 - Section 2308.10.8.1 of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code is amended 
to read as follows: 

 
2308.10.8.1 Foundation requirements. Braced wall lines shall be supported by continuous 
foundations. 

 
Exception: For structures with a maximum plan dimension not more than 50 feet (15,240 
mm), continuous foundations are required at exterior walls only for structures assigned to 
Seismic Design Category A, B, or C. 

For structures in Seismic Design Categories D and E, exterior braced wall panels shall be in 
the same plane vertically with the foundation or the portion of the structure containing the offset 
shall be designed in accordance with accepted engineering practice and Section 2308.1.1. 

  



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 27  

 

§ 8029 - Section 2308.10.9 of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read 
as follows: 

2308.10.9 Attachment of sheathing. Fastening of braced wall panel sheathing shall not be 
less than that prescribed in Tables 2308.6.1 or 2304.10.2. Wall sheathing shall not be attached 
to framing members by adhesives. Staple fasteners in Table 2304.10.2 shall not be used to 
resist or transfer seismic forces in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E, or F. 

 
Exception: Staples may be used to resist or transfer seismic forces when the allowable 
shear values are substantiated by cyclic testing and approved by the building official. 
 

All braced wall panels shall extend to the roof sheathing and shall be attached to parallel roof 
rafters or blocking above with framing clips (18 gauge minimum) spaced at maximum 24 inches 
(6,096 mm) on center with four 8d nails per leg (total eight 8d nails per clip). Braced wall panels 
shall be laterally braced at each top corner and at maximum 24 inches (6,096 mm) intervals 
along the top plate of discontinuous vertical framing. 

 
§ 8030 - Section 3114 of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read as 
follows: 

 
SECTION 3114 

INTERMODAL SHIPPING CONTAINERS 
 

3114.1 General. The provisions of Section 3114 and other applicable sections of this code 
shall apply to intermodal shipping containers that are repurposed for use as buildings or 
structures, or as a part of buildings or structures. 

 
Exceptions: 
1. lntermodal shipping containers previously approved as existing relocatable buildings 

complying with Chapter 14 of the California Existing Building Code. 
2. Stationary battery storage arrays located in intermodal shipping containers complying 

with Chapter 12 of the California Fire Code. 
3. lntermodal shipping containers that are listed as equipment complying with the 

standard for equipment, such as air chillers, engine generators, modular data centers, 
and other similar equipment. 

4. lntermodal shipping containers housing or supporting experimental equipment are 
exempt from the requirements of Section 3114, provided they comply with all of the 
following: 
4.1. Such units will be single stand-alone units supported at grade level and used 

only for occupancies as specified under Risk Category I in Table 1604.5. 

4.2. Such units are located a minimum of 8 feet (2,438 mm) from adjacent 
structures, and are not connected to a fuel gas system or fuel gas utility. 

4.3. In hurricane-prone regions and flood hazard areas, such units are designed in 
accordance with the applicable provisions of Chapter 16. 

5. [HCD] Shipping containers constructed or converted off-site that meet the definition of 
Factory-built Housing in Health and Safety Code Section 19971 or Commercial 
Modular(s) as defined in Health and Safety Code Section 18001.8 shall be approved 
by the Department of Housing and Community Development. 

6. Single-unit stand-alone intermodal shipping containers used as temporary storage or 
construction trailer on active construction sites. Construction support facilities for uses 
and activities not directly associated with the actual processes of construction, 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 28  

including but not limited to, offices, meeting rooms, plan rooms, other administrative or 
support functions shall not be exempt from Section 3114. 

 
3114.2 Construction documents. The construction documents shall contain information to verify 
the dimensions and establish the physical properties of the steel components and wood floor 
components of the intermodal shipping container, in addition to the information required by 
Sections 107 and 1603. 

 
3114.3 lntermodal shipping container information. lntermodal shipping containers shall bear 
an existing data plate containing the following information as required by ISO 6346 and verified 
by an approved agency. A report of the verification process and findings shall be provided to the 
building owner. 
 

1. Manufacturer's name or identification number. 
2. Date manufactured. 
3. Safety approval number. 
4. Identification number. 
5. Maximum operating gross mass or weight (kg) (lbs), 
6. Allowable stacking load for 1.8G (kg) (lbs). 
7. Transverse racking test force (Newtons). 
8. Valid maintenance examination date. 

 
Where approved by the building official, the markings and existing data plate are permitted to be 
removed from the intermodal shipping containers before they are repurposed for use as buildings 
or structures or as part of buildings or structures. 

 
3114.4 Protection against decay and termites. Wood structural floors of intermodal shipping 
containers shall be protected from decay and termites in accordance with the applicable provisions 
of Section 2304.12.1.1. 

 
3114.5 Under-floor ventilation. The space between the bottom of the floor joists and the earth 
under any intermodal shipping container, except spaces occupied by basements and cellars, shall 
be provided with ventilation in accordance with Section 1202.4. 

 
3114.6 Roof assemblies. lntermodal shipping container roof assemblies shall comply with the 
applicable requirements of Chapter 15. 

 
Exception: Single-unit, stand-alone intermodal shipping containers not attached to, or stacked 
vertically over, other intermodal shipping containers, buildings or structures. 

 
3114.7 Joints and voids. Joints and voids that create concealed spaces between intermodal 
shipping containers, that are connected or stacked, at fire-resistance-rated walls, floor or 
floor/ceiling assemblies and roofs or roof/ceiling assemblies shall be protected by an approved 
fire-resistant joint system in accordance with Section 715. 

3114.8 Structural. lntermodal shipping containers that conform to ISO 1496-1 and are repurposed 
for use as buildings or structures, or as a part of buildings or structures, shall be designed in 
accordance with Chapter 16 and this section. 

 
3114.8.1 Foundations and supports. lntermodal shipping containers repurposed for use as 
a permanent building or structure shall be supported on foundations or other supporting 
structures designed and constructed in accordance with Chapters 16 through 23. 

 
  



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 29  

 
3114.8.1.1 Anchorage. lntermodal shipping containers shall be anchored to foundations or 
other supporting structures as necessary to provide a continuous load path for all applicable 
design and environmental loads in accordance with Chapter 16. 

 
3114.8.1.2 Stacking. lntermodal shipping containers used to support stacked units shall 
comply with Section 3115.8.4. 

 
3114.8.2 Welds. The strength of new welds and connections shall be no less than the strength 
provided by the original connections. All new welds and connections shall be designed and 
constructed in accordance with Chapters 16, 17 and 22. 
 
3115.8.3 Structural design. The structural design of the intermodal shipping containers 
repurposed for use as a building or structure, or as part of a building or structure, shall comply 
with Section 3115.8.4 or 3115.8.5. 

3114.8.4 Detailed structural design procedure. A structural analysis meeting the 
requirements of this section shall be provided to the building official to demonstrate the 
structural adequacy of the intermodal shipping containers. 

 
Exception: Structures using an intermodal shipping containers designed in accordance 
with Section 3115.8.5. 

3114.8.4.1 Material properties. Structural material properties for existing intermodal 
shipping container steel components shall be established by Section 2202. 

 
3114.8.4.2 Seismic design parameters. The seismic force-resisting system shall be 
designed and detailed in accordance with ASCE 7 and one of the following: 

1 Where all or portions of the profiled steel panel elements are considered to be the 
seismic force-resisting system, design and detailing shall be in accordance with 
AISI S100 and ASCE 7, Table 12.2-1 requirements for steel systems not 
specifically detailed for seismic resistance, excluding cantilevered column systems. 

2. Where all or portions of the profiled steel panel elements are not considered to be part 
of the seismic force-resisting system, an independent seismic force-resisting 
system shall be selected and detailed in accordance with ASCE 7, Table 12.2-1, or 

 
3. Where all or portions of the profiled steel panel elements are retained and 

integrated into a seismic force-resisting system other than as permitted by Section 
3114.8.4.2_1tem 1, seismic design parameters shall be developed from testing and 
analysis in accordance with Section 104:11 and ASCE 7, Section 12.2.1.1 or 
12.2.1.2. 

3114.8.4.3 Allowable shear value. The allowable shear values for the profiled steel panel 
side walls and end walls shall be determined in accordance with the design approach 
selected in Section 3114.8.4.2. Where penetrations are made in the side walls or end walls 
designated as part of the lateral force-resisting system, the penetrations shall be 
substantiated by rational analysis. 

3114.8.5 Simplified structural design procedure of single-unit containers. Single-unit 
intermodal shipping containers conforming to the limitations of Section 3114.8.5.1 shall be 
permitted to be designed in accordance with Sections 3114.8.5.2 and 3114.8.5.3. 





ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 31  
 

4.1 The opening shall be framed with steel elements that are designed in 
accordance with Chapters 16 and 22. 

 
4.2 The cross section and material grade of any new steel element shall be equal 

to or greater than the steel element removed. 
 

5. A maximum of one penetration not greater than a 6-inch (152 mm) diameter hole 
for conduits, pipes, tubes or vents, or not greater than16 square inches (10 
322mm2) for electrical boxes, is permitted for each individual 8 feet (2438 mm) 
length of lateral force-resisting wall. Penetrations located in walls that are not part 
of the wall lateral force resisting system shall not be limited in size or quantity. 
Existing intermodal shipping container's vents shall not be considered a 
penetration, as shown in Figure 3114.8.5.3(4). 

 
6. End wall door or doors designated as part of the lateral force-resisting system shall 

be intermittently welded closed around the full perimeters of the door panels. 
 
 

TABLE 3114.8.5.3 
ALLOWABLE SHEAR VALUES FOR PROFILED STEEL PANEL 

SIDE WALLS AND END WALLS FOR WIND OR SEISMIC LOADING 
 

CONTAINER 
DESIGNATION 2 

CONTAINER 
DIMENSION 

(Nominal Length) 

CONTAINER 
DIMENSION 

(Nominal Height) 

ALLOWABLE SHEAR VALUES 
(PLF) 1•3 

   Side Wall End Wall 
1EEE 

45 feet (13.7 M) 
9.5 feet (2896 mm) 

75 
 
 
 
 
 

 
843 

1EE 8.6 feet (2591 mm) 
1AAA 

 
40 feet (12.2 M) 

9.5 feet (2896 mm) 
 

84 
1AA 8.5 feet (2592 mm) 
1A 8. 0 feet (2438 mm) 

1AX <8.0 feet (2483 mm) 
1BBB 

 
30 feet (9.1 M) 

9.5 feet (2896 mm) 
 

112 
1BB 8.5 feet (2591 mm) 
1B 8.0 feet (2438 mm) 

1BX <8.0 feet (2438 mm) 
1CC  

20 feet (9.1 M) 
8.5 feet (2591 mm)  

168 1C 8.0 feet (2438 mm) 
1CX <8.0 feet (2438 mm) 

The allowable strength for the side walls and end walls of the intermodal shipping containers are derived from ISO 1496-1 and 
reduced by a factor of safety of 5. 

2. Container designation type is derived from ISO 668, 
3. Limitations of Sections 3114.8.5.1 and 3114.8.5.3 shall apply. 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 32 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 

FIGURE 3114.8.5.3(1) 
BRACING UNIT DISTRIBUTION – MAXIMUM LINEAR LENGTH 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

FIGURE 3114.8.5.3(2) 
BRACING UNIT DISTRIBUTION – MINIMUM LINEAR LENGTH 

 
 
 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 33 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

FIGURE 3114.8.5.3(3) 
BRACING UNIT DISTRIBUTION – BOUNDARY ELEMENTS 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

FIGURE 3114.8.5.3(4) 
BRACING UNIT DISTRIBUTION – PENETRATING LIMITATIONS 

  



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 34 

SECTION 3: CEQA. The City Council finds that this Ordinance is not subject to the 
California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) pursuant to Sections 15060(c)(2) (the activity 
will not result in a direct or reasonably foreseeable indirect physical change in the 
environment) and 15060(c)(3) (the activity is not a project as defined in Section 15378) of 
the CEQA Guidelines, California Code of Regulations, Title 14, Chapter 3, because it has 
no potential for resulting in physical change to the environment, directly or indirectly. The 
City Council hereby directs City staff to file a Notice of Exemption with the Clerk of Los 
Angeles County within five (5) days of the adoption of this Ordinance. 

SECTION 4: SAVINGS CLAUSE. Neither the adoption of this Ordinance nor the 
repeal of any other Ordinance or provision of the Downey Municipal Code referenced in this 
Ordinance shall affect in any manner any offense or act committed or done or any penalty 
or forfeiture incurred, or any right established or accruing before the effective date of this 
Ordinance; nor shall it affect any prosecution, suit, or proceeding pending or any judgment 
rendered prior to the effective date of this Ordinance.  The provisions of this Ordinance, 
insofar as they are substantially the same as ordinance provisions previously adopted by 
the City relating to the same subject matter, shall be construed as restatements and 
continuations, and not as new enactments.  The provisions of this Ordinance shall have 
priority over substantially similar provisions previously adopted by the City relating to the 
same subject matter. 

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY.  If any section, subsection, paragraph, sentence, 
clause, or phrase of this Ordinance is declared by a court of competent jurisdiction to be 
unconstitutional or otherwise invalid, such decision shall not affect the validity of the 
remaining portions of this Ordinance. The City Council declares that it would have adopted 
this Ordinance, and each section, subsection, paragraph, sentence, clause, phrase, or 
portion thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, 
paragraphs, phrases, or portions thereof be declared invalid or unconstitutional. 

SECTION 6: URGENCY. The City Council finds and declares that this Urgency 
Ordinance is required for the immediate preservation and protection of the public peace, 
health, safety, and welfare for the reasons set forth hereinabove. 

SECTION 7: This Urgency Ordinance is adopted pursuant to Government Code 
Section 36937(b) and shall become effective immediately upon its adoption by a four-fifths 
(4/5th) vote of the City Council. 

SECTION 8: The City Clerk shall certify to the adoption of this Ordinance and cause 
the same to be published in the manner prescribed by law. 

APPROVED AND ADOPTED this 13th day of January, 2026. 

CLAUDIA M. FROMETA, Mayor 

ATTEST: 

MARIA ALICIA DUARTE, CMC    
City Clerk 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1531 
PAGE 35 

APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

JOHN M. FUNK 
City Attorney 

STATE OF CALIFORNIA        ) 
COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES ) ss: 
CITY OF DOWNEY                 )       

I HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing Uncodified Urgency Ordinance No. 26-1531 was 
introduced and adopted at a Regular Meeting of the City Council of the City of Downey held on 
the 13th day of January, 2026, by the following vote, to wit: 

  AYES: Council Members: 
 NOES: Council Member: 

  ABSENT: Council Member: 
  ABSTAIN: Council Member: 

I FURTHER CERTIFY that a Summary of the foregoing Uncodified Urgency Ordinance 
No. 26-1531, was published in the Downey Patriot, a newspaper of general circulation in the City 
of Downey, on January 1, 2026, (before adoption) and on January 15, 2026, (after adoption).  It 
was also posted in the regular posting places in the City of Downey on the same dates. 

MARIA ALICIA DUARTE, CMC    
City Clerk 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1532 
 
AN URGENCY ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
DOWNEY REPEALING AND RECASTING SECTION 8730 (GRADING 
REGULATIONS) OF CHAPTER 8 (FLOODPLAIN MANAGEMENT, 
GRADING AND PAVING) OF THE DOWNEY MUNICIPAL CODE AND 
ADDING A NEW SECTION 8730 (DOWNEY GRADING REGULATIONS) TO 
CHAPTER 8 (FLOODPLAIN MANAGEMENT, GRADING AND PAVING) OF 
THE DOWNEY MUNICIPAL CODE BY ADOPTING BY REFERENCE 
APPENDIX J OF THE 2025 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE (CALIFORNIA 
CODE OF REGULATIONS TITLE 24, PART 2); AND MAKING CERTAIN 
LOCAL ADDITIONS AND AMENDMENTS THERETO 

 

WHEREAS, pursuant to Government Code Section 50022.1 et seq., the City of Downey 
may adopt by reference the California Building Standards Code, 2025 Edition, as provided in Title 
24 of the California Code of Regulations, including its Appendices; and, 

WHEREAS, Appendix J (Grading) of the California Building Code provides optional 
standards related to the erection and maintenance of signs, and local jurisdictions are not obligated 
to adopt Appendix J; and, 

WHEREAS, Sections 17958, 17958.7, and 18941.5 of the California Health & Safety Code 
provide that prior to making any change or modification to the California Building Standards Code 
authorized by the Health & Safety Code, the City Council of the City of Downey is required to make 
an express finding that such modifications or changes are reasonably necessary because of local 
climatic, geological, or topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, as approved by the Governor on June 30, 2025, California Assembly 
Bill 130 (“AB 130), amongst other actions, amended Health & Safety Code Sections 17958, 
17958.5, 17958.7, and 18941.5 by prohibiting local jurisdictions from making any modifications to 
the building standards between October 1, 2025 and June 1, 2031, that affect residential units 
unless at least one of several specified conditions exist, including a finding that the local 
amendments are “substantially equivalent” to prior modifications that were filed by the governing 
body of the local jurisdiction and that were in effect as of September 30, 2025; and, 

 
WHEREAS, the City of Downey desires to adopt by reference Appendix J of the California 

Building Code (California Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 2); together with the necessary 
amendments to assure the Code is tailored to the particular safety needs of the City as required by 
its unique climatic, geological, and/or topographical conditions; and; and, 

 
WHEREAS, the Building Official has recommended that changes and modifications be 

made to Appendix J, and has advised that that certain changes and modifications to the Code are 
reasonably necessary due to local climatic, geological, and/or topographical conditions within the 
City of Downey – each of which is substantially equivalent to previous modifications enacted by 
the City Council of the City of Downey that were filed with the California Building Standards 
Commission and were in effect as of September 30, 2025, and has further advised that the 
remainder of said changes and modifications are of an administrative or procedural nature, 
or concern themselves with subjects not covered by the Code, or are reasonably necessary 
to safeguard life and property within the City of Downey; and, 

 
WHEREAS, the Building Official has also recommended that changes and modifications 

be made to Appendix J, which are necessary for administrative clarification and to establish 
administrative standards for the efficient enforcement of the building standards of the City of 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1532 
PAGE 2 
  

Downey and which do not modify a building standard pursuant to California Health and Safety 
Code Sections 17958, 17958.7, 18941.5; and, 

WHEREAS, the local amendments incorporated into this Ordinance are substantially 
equivalent to amendments previously enacted by the City Council of the City of Downey as a result 
of local climatic, geological, and/or topographical conditions and which were filed with the California 
Building Standards Commission and in effect as of September 30, 2025; and, 

WHEREAS, in accordance with California Government Code Section 36937(b) and 
Downey City Charter Sections 511 and 514, and based upon the recitals set forth herein, the City 
Council finds that the adoption of this Urgency Ordinance is necessary in order to preserve the 
immediate public peace, health, safety, and general welfare, as the 2025 Edition of the California 
Building Code becomes effective on January 1, 2026 without consideration of the local 
amendments set forth herein; and, 

WHEREAS, notice of a public hearing on this Ordinance was published in the Downey 
Patriot, a newspaper of general circulation in the City, on January 1, 2026; and, 

 
WHEREAS, the City Council held a duly-noticed public meeting on January 13, 2026, as 

required by law, at which time the Council determined that the adoption of the Code is in the best 
interest of the City and is based upon the express findings required by law; and, 

 
WHEREAS, at least one copy of Appendix J of the 2025 California Building Code that is 

being adopted by reference in this Ordinance was available for public inspection at the office of 
the City Clerk fifteen (15) days preceding the public hearing pursuant to Government Code Section 
50022.6. 

 
NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DOWNEY DOES HEREBY 

ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 1: Findings. The City Council hereby finds that the proposed amendments to 
the 2025 California Building Code are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geologic, 
of topographic conditions, and adopts the findings provided below to support the modifications to 
the 2025 California Building Code. The City Council further finds that some changes and 
modifications are of an administrative or procedural nature, or concern themselves with subjects 
not covered by the code, or are reasonably necessary to safeguard life and property within the City. 
The City Council hereby adopts the following (Climatic, geological, and topographical, where 
applicable) findings to support the proposed amendments to the 2025 California Building Code 
made in this Ordinance: 

I. Climatic Conditions 
 

A. The jurisdiction of the City of Downey (or, "City") is located in a semi-arid 
Mediterranean type climate. It annually experiences extended periods of high 
temperatures with little or no precipitation. For example, during July, August and 
September, temperatures often exceed 100 degrees Fahrenheit. During the same 
months humidity is usually less than 40%, and humidity measurements less than 
10% are not uncommon. These conditions contribute to an increased likelihood of 
fire. Moreover, minor fires have a greater tendency of spreading rapidly due to such 
conditions. The City, being in the Southern California area, is also subject to 
"Sundowner" or "Santa Ana" winds that, should a fire occur, cause the fire to spread 
rapidly over wood shake roofs which are common in the residential areas. These 
hot, dry (Santa Ana} winds may reach speeds of 70 M.P.H. or greater. These 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1532 
PAGE 3 
  

climatic conditions cause extreme drying of vegetation and common building 
materials. Frequent periods of drought and low humidity add to the fire danger. 
This predisposes the area to large destructive fires (conflagration). In addition to 
directly damaging or destroying buildings, these fires are also prone to disrupt utility 
services throughout the City. Obstacles generated by a strong wind, such as fallen 
trees, street lights and utility poles, and the requirement to climb 75 feet vertically 
up flights of stairs will greatly impact the response time to reach an incident scene. 
Additionally, there is a significant increase in the amount of wind force at 60 feet 
above the ground. Use of aerial type fire-fighting apparatus above this height would 
place rescue personnel at increased risk of injury. 

 
B. Water demand in this densely populated area far exceeds the quantity supplied by 

natural precipitation; and although the population continues to grow, the already 
taxed water supply does not. California is projected to increase in population by 
nearly 10 million over the next quarter of a century with 50 percent of that growth 
centered in Southern California. Due to storage capacities and consumption, and 
a limited amount of rainfall, future water allocation is not fully dependable. This 
necessitates the need for additional and on-site fire protection features. It would 
also leave tall buildings vulnerable to uncontrolled fires due to a lack of available 
water and an inability to pump sufficient quantities of available water to floors in a 
fire. 

 
C. These dry climatic conditions and winds contribute to the rapid spread of even small 

fires originating in high-density housing or vegetation. These fires spread very 
quickly and create a need for increased levels of fire protection. The added 
protection of fire sprinkler systems and other fire protection features will supplement 
normal fire department response by providing immediate protection for the building 
occupants and by containing and controlling the fire spread to the area of origin. Fire 
sprinkler systems will also reduce the use of water for firefighting by as much as 50 
to 75 percent. 

II. Topographical conditions 
 

A. Development has occurred in the City and continues to occur in the City and such 
development has resulted in severe traffic congestion during peak business hours, 
weekends and holidays, thus decreasing the response time of fire and emergency 
service vehicles, particularly on the following streets and highways: Florence 
Avenue, Firestone Boulevard, Imperial Highway, Paramount Boulevard, Lakewood 
Boulevard, Brookshire Avenue, Bellflower Boulevard. 

 
B. These topographical conditions combine to create a situation which places fire 

department response time to fire occurrences at risk, and makes it necessary to 
provide automatic on-site fire-extinguishing systems and other protection measures 
to protect occupants and property. Due to these topographical conditions and the 
expected infrastructure damage inherent in seismic zones described below, it is 
prudent to rely on automatic fire sprinkler systems to mitigate extended fire 
department response time and keep fires manageable with reduced fire flow (water) 
requirements for a given structure. Numerous fires have occurred within the City in 
residential structures (houses, apartments, hotels, motels, and dormitories) over 
the past several years that have automatic fire protection systems, and in all of 
these fires, the automatic fire protection systems have successfully controlled 
and/or suppressed the fire before the emergency response personnel have been 
able to arrive at the structure. Additional fire protection is also justified to match the 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1532 
PAGE 4 
  

current resources of firefighting equipment and personnel within the fire 
department. 

Ill. Geological Conditions 
 

A. The City of Downey is located in Southern California, in an extremely active seismic 
region, with high levels of historic earthquake shaking in the recent past 
(earthquakes measuring larger than a magnitude 5 on the Richter Scale) and can 
be expected to experience significant strong ground shaking within the foreseeable 
future. The City is a densely populated area that has buildings constructed over 
and near a vast and complex network of faults that increase the likelihood of 
catastrophic damage when a seismic event occurs and which are believed to be 
capable of producing future earthquakes similar or greater in size to the 1994 
Northridge, the 1987 Whittier Narrows Earthquake, the 1971 Sylmar earthquakes 
and 1933 Long Beach Earthquake. 

 
B. The seismotectonic setting of the City is dominated by the Norwalk fault, which 

traverses the northern portion of the City. The City is also in close proximity to the 
San Andreas Fault, which is located 40 miles to the northeast, the Whittier fault, 
located 10 miles to the northeast and the Newport-Inglewood fault, located 10 miles 
to the southwest. In the event of a severe earthquake, these faults present the 
potential for catastrophic damage, including fire, damage to roadways and other 
impairments of emergency apparatus. Existing and planned developments are at 
risk from structural damage from earthquake faults.  Improved standards are 
necessary to ensure that maximum safety is provided to persons and property. 

 
C. Previous earthquakes have been accompanied by disruption of traffic flow and 

fires. A severe seismic event has the potential to negatively impact any rescue or 
fire suppression activities because it is likely to create obstacles similar to those 
indicated under the high wind section above. This situation creates the need for 
both additional fire protection and automatic on-site fire protection for building 
occupants. 

 
IV. The findings above are applicable to the Amendments to Appendix J of the 2025 

California Residential Code as follows: 
 

2025 CBC, Appendix J, 
Section Amended or Added 

TITLE/DESCRIPTION FINDINGS 
(Administrative, 

I, II, Ill) 
J103.1 Amend Appendix J Section 

J103.1, "Permits Required" 
Administrative 

J103.2 Amend Appendix J Section 
J103.2, "Exemptions," Item 8 

Administrative 

J104.1 Amend Appendix J Section 
J104.1, "Submittal 

Requirements" 

Administrative 

J105.1 Amend Appendix J Section 
J105.1, "Inspections" 

Administrative 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1532 
PAGE 5 
  

J112 Add Appendix J Section J112, 
"Fees" 

Administrative 

J113 Add Appendix J Section J113, 
"Refunds" 

Administrative 

J114 Add Appendix J Section J114, 
"Subsurface Drainage" 

I, Ill 

 
 

SECTION 2: Section 8730 ("Grading Regulations") of Chapter 8 ("Floodplain Management, 
Grading And Paving") of the Downey Municipal Code is hereby amended in its entirety to read as 
follows: 

"CHAPTER 8. 
DOWNEY GRADING REGULATIONS 

§ 8730 - Adoption by reference of California Building Code, Appendix J. Except as provided 
herein, Appendix J of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code (California Code of 
Regulations, Title 24, Part 2), based upon the 2024 International Building Code, is hereby adopted 
by reference as fully set forth herein, and shall constitute and is hereby established as the "Downey 
Grading Regulations." A copy of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code, including 
Appendix J, is on file in the Building and Safety Division and the Office of the City Clerk for use and 
examination by the public. 

§ 8731 - SECTION J103.1 of Appendix J of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code is 
amended to read as follows: 

J103.1 - Permits required. Except as exempted in Section J103.2, grading 
shall not be performed without first having obtained a permit therefor from the Building 
Official. A grading permit does not include the construction of retaining walls or other 
structures. A separate permit shall be required for each site; each permit may cover 
both excavations and fills at the same time. 

§ 8732 - SECTION J103.2, Item 8, of Appendix J of the 2025 Edition of the California Building 
Code is added under "Exemptions" to read as follows: 

8. Cut and fill less than fifty (50) cubic yards and placed on natural terrain with 
a slope flatter than five (5) horizontal to one (1) vertical, or less than three (3) feet in 
depth, not intended to support structures, which do not exceed fifty (50) cubic yards 
on any one lot and does not obstruct a drainage course. 

§ 8733- SECTION J104.1 of Appendix J of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code is 
amended to read as follows: 

J104.1 - Submittal requirements. In addition to the provisions of Section 
8999.28.3, the applicant shall state the estimated quantities of excavation and fill. 

§ 8734 - SECTION J105.1 of Appendix J of the 2025 Edition of the California Building Code is 
amended to read as follows: 

J105.1 - Inspections. Inspections shall be governed by section 8999.38 of 
Downey Municipal Code. 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1532 
PAGE 6 
  

§ 8735 - Section J112 is added to Appendix J of the 2025 Edition of the California Building 
Code to read as follows: 

J112 Fees. 

J112.1 Payment of Fees. A permit shall not be valid until the fees prescribed 
as set forth in the City of Downey Schedule of Fees have been paid, nor shall an 
amendment to a permit be released until the additional fee, if any, has been paid. 

J112.2 Schedule of Fees. On excavation and/or fill requiring a permit, a fee 
for each permit shall be paid as required, in accordance with the Schedule of Fees 
established by resolution of the City Council. 

J112.3 Work Commencing Before Permit Issuance. Any person who 
commences any work on grading before obtaining the necessary permits shall be 
subject to an investigation fee to be made before any permit may be issued for such 
work. An investigation fee in addition to the permit fee shall be collected whether or not 
a permit is then or subsequently issued for the illegal work. The investigation fee shall 
be equal to the amount of a permit fee required by this chapter for the commenced or 
completed work as set forth in the City adopted fee schedule. The payment of such 
investigation fee shall not exempt any person from compliance with all other provisions 
of this title or Downey Municipal Article VIII Chapter 5-33, nor from any penalty 
prescribed by law. 

§ 8736 - Section J113 is added to Appendix J of the 2025 Edition of the California Building 
Code to read as follows: 

J112 Refunds. 
 
J113.1 The Building Official may authorize the refunding of any fee paid 

hereunder which was erroneously paid or collected. 

J113.2 The Building Official may authorize the refunding of not more than eighty 
(80%) percent of the grading permit fee paid when no work has been done under a 
permit issued in accordance with this title. The Building Official may authorize the 
refunding of not more than eighty (80%) percent of the plan review fee paid when an 
application is withdrawn or canceled before any plan reviewing has been started. 

J113.3 The Building Official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid 
except upon written application filed by the original permittee not later than one hundred 
eighty (180) days after the date of fee payment 

§ 8737 - Section J114 is added to Appendix J of the 2025 Edition of the California Building 
Code to read as follows: 

J114 - Subsurface Drainage. Cut and fill slopes shall be provided with 
subsurface drainage as necessary for stability." 

 
 
SECTION 3: CEQA. The City Council finds that this Ordinance is not subject to the 

California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) pursuant to Sections 15060(c)(2) (the activity will not 
result in a direct or reasonably foreseeable indirect physical change in the environment) and 
15060(c)(3) (the activity is not a project as defined in Section 15378) of the CEQA Guidelines, 
California Code of Regulations, Title 14, Chapter 3, because it has no potential for resulting in 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1532 
PAGE 7 
  

physical change to the environment, directly or indirectly. The City Council hereby directs City staff 
to file a Notice of Exemption with the Clerk of Los Angeles County within five (5) days of the adoption 
of this Ordinance. 
 

SECTION 4: SAVINGS CLAUSE. Neither the adoption of this Ordinance nor the repeal of 
any other Ordinance or provision of the Downey Municipal Code referenced in this Ordinance shall 
affect in any manner any offense or act committed or done or any penalty or forfeiture incurred, or 
any right established or accruing before the effective date of this Ordinance; nor shall it affect any 
prosecution, suit, or proceeding pending or any judgment rendered prior to the effective date of this 
Ordinance.  The provisions of this Ordinance, insofar as they are substantially the same as 
ordinance provisions previously adopted by the City relating to the same subject matter, shall be 
construed as restatements and continuations, and not as new enactments.  The provisions of this 
Ordinance shall have priority over substantially similar provisions previously adopted by the City 
relating to the same subject matter. 

 
SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY.  If any section, subsection, paragraph, sentence, clause, or 

phrase of this Ordinance is declared by a court of competent jurisdiction to be unconstitutional or 
otherwise invalid, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this 
Ordinance. The City Council declares that it would have adopted this Ordinance, and each section, 
subsection, paragraph, sentence, clause, phrase, or portion thereof, irrespective of the fact that any 
one or more sections, subsections, paragraphs, phrases, or portions thereof be declared invalid or 
unconstitutional. 

 
SECTION 6: URGENCY. The City Council finds and declares that this Urgency Ordinance 

is required for the immediate preservation and protection of the public peace, health, safety, and 
welfare for the reasons set forth hereinabove. 

 
SECTION 7: This Urgency Ordinance is adopted pursuant to Government Code Section 

36937(b) and shall become effective immediately upon its adoption by a four-fifths (4/5th) vote of 
the City Council. 

 
SECTION 8: The City Clerk shall certify to the adoption of this Ordinance and cause the 

same to be published in the manner prescribed by law. 
 

APPROVED AND ADOPTED this 13th day of January, 2026. 
 
 
             

CLAUDIA M. FROMETA, Mayor 
 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
       
MARIA ALICIA DUARTE, CMC                                        
City Clerk 
 
 
 
 
APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1532 
PAGE 8 

JOHN M. FUNK 
City Attorney 

STATE OF CALIFORNIA        ) 
COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES ) ss: 
CITY OF DOWNEY                 )   

I HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing Uncodified Urgency Ordinance No. 26-1532 was 
introduced and adopted at a Regular Meeting of the City Council of the City of Downey held on the 13th 
day of January, 2026, by the following vote, to wit: 

  AYES: Council Members: 
  NOES: Council Member: 
  ABSENT: Council Member: 
  ABSTAIN: Council Member: 

I FURTHER CERTIFY that a Summary of the foregoing Uncodified Urgency Ordinance No. 26-
1532, was published in the Downey Patriot, a newspaper of general circulation in the City of Downey, on 
January 1, 2026, (before adoption) and on January 15, 2026, (after adoption).  It was also posted in the 
regular posting places in the City of Downey on the same dates. 

MARIA ALICIA DUARTE, CMC    
City Clerk 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1533 

AN URGENCY ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 
CITY OF DOWNEY REPEALING AND RECASTING CHAPTER 13 
(DOWNEY RESIDENTIAL CODE) OF ARTICLE VIII (BUILDING 
REGULATIONS) OF THE DOWNEY MUNICIPAL CODE; 
ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE 2025 CALIFORNIA 
RESIDENTIAL CODE (CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS 
TITLE 24, PART 2.5) AND APPENDICES BB, BF, BG, AND C1; 
AND MAKING CERTAIN LOCAL ADDITIONS AND 
AMENDMENTS THERETO 

 
WHEREAS, pursuant to California Government Code Section 50022.1 et 

seq., the City of Downey may adopt by reference the California Building Standards 
Code, 2025 Edition, as provided in Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations, 
including the Residential Code; and, 

 
WHEREAS, Sections 17922, 17958, and 18941.5 of the California Health 

and Safety Code provide that the governing body of every city or county shall adopt 
ordinances or regulations imposing the same requirements as those contained in 
the most recently adopted version of the California Building Standards Code; and, 

 
WHEREAS, the appendices to the California Building Code (inclusive of 

Appendices BB, BF, BG, and C1) provide optional guidelines for specific topics – 
including Tiny Houses, Patio Covers, and Sound Transmission, however, the 
adoption of these appendices by local jurisdictions is not mandatory by their own 
terms; 

 
WHEREAS, Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7, and 18941.5 of the 

California Health & Safety Code provide that a city or county may make such 
changes or modifications to the requirements contained in the California Building 
Standards Code which are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, 
geological, or topographical conditions; and, 

 
WHEREAS, Sections 17958, 17958.7, and 18941.5 of the California Health 

& Safety Code provide that prior to making any change or modification to the 
California Building Standards Code authorized by the Health & Safety Code, the 
City Council of Downey is required to make an express finding that such 
modifications or changes are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, 
geological, or topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, as approved by the Governor on June 30, 2025, California 
Assembly Bill 130 (“AB 130), amongst other actions, amended Health & Safety 
Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7, and 18941.5 by prohibiting local 
jurisdictions from making any modifications to the building standards between 
October 1, 2025 and June 1, 2031, that affect residential units unless at least one 
of several specified conditions exist, including a finding that the local amendments 
are “substantially equivalent” to prior modifications that were filed by the governing 
body of the local jurisdiction and that were in effect as of September 30, 2025; and, 

WHEREAS, the local amendments incorporated into this Ordinance are 
substantially equivalent to amendments previously enacted by the City Council of 
the City of Downey as a result of local climatic, geological, and/or topographical 
conditions and which were filed with the California Building Standards Commission 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1533 
PAGE 2 
 
  

and in effect as of September 30, 2025; and, 
 

WHEREAS, the City Council of Downey is not required to make an express 
finding for amendments necessary to carry out the application of the Building 
Standards code and/or that do not otherwise modify a Building Standard; and, 

WHEREAS, because the City of Downey is in a liquefaction zone, the flood 
hazard section of this code has been amended; and, 

 
WHEREAS, the City of Downey is in Climate Zone 8 and, therefore, is 

required to have more stringent energy efficiency requirements; and, 
 

WHEREAS, the City of Downey is subject to ground tremors from large 
seismic events along, but not limited to, the San Andreas Fault; and, 

 
WHEREAS, Southern California is a densely populated area, with a warmer 

climate than average. A high percentage of the population in Downey has a 
swimming pool. The fencing section has been amended considering the additional 
safety aspects to be considered; and, 

 
WHEREAS, the City of Downey has a low rainfall average which contributes 

to dust and debris being scattered by winds. This has been addressed by way of 
amendments to this code; and, 

 
WHEREAS, the City of Downey desires to adopt the 2025 California 

Residential Code as set forth in California Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 2.5, 
including Appendices BB, BF, BG, and C1; together with the necessary 
amendments to assure the Code is tailored to the particular safety needs of the City 
as required by its unique climatic, geological, and topographical conditions; and, 

 
WHEREAS, the Building Official has recommended that changes and 

modifications be made to the Code, and has advised that certain changes and 
modifications to the Code are reasonably necessary due to local conditions within 
the City of Downey, and has further advised that the remainder of said changes 
and modifications are of an administrative or procedural nature, or concern 
themselves with subjects not covered by the Code, or are reasonably necessary to 
safeguard life and property within the City of Downey; and, 

WHEREAS, in accordance with California Government Code Section 
36937(b) and Downey City Charter Sections 511 and 514, and based upon the 
recitals set forth herein, the City Council finds that the adoption of this Urgency 
Ordinance is necessary in order to preserve the immediate public peace, health, 
safety, and general welfare, as the 2025 Edition of the California Residential Code 
becomes effective on January 1, 2026 without consideration of the local 
amendments set forth herein; and, 

WHEREAS, notice of a public hearing on this Ordinance was published in 
the Downey Patriot, a newspaper of general circulation in the City, on January 1, 
2026; and, 
 

WHEREAS, the City Council held a duly-noticed public meeting on January 
13, 2026, as required by law, at which time the Council determined that the adoption 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1533 
PAGE 3 
 
  

of the Code is in the best interest of the City and is based upon the express findings 
required by law; and, 

 
WHEREAS, at least one copy of the Code adopted by reference in this 

Ordinance was available for public inspection at the office of the City Clerk fifteen 
(15) days preceding the public hearing pursuant to Government Code Section 
50022.6. 

 
NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DOWNEY 
DOES HEREBY ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS: 

 
SECTION 1. Findings. The City Council hereby finds that the proposed 

amendments to the 2025 California Residential Code are reasonably necessary 
because of local climatic, geologic, of topographic conditions, and adopts the 
findings provided below to support the modifications to the 2025 California 
Residential Code. The City Council also finds that the proposed amendments 
affecting residential units are substantially equivalent to previous modifications 
enacted by the City Council of the City of Downey that were filed with the California 
Building Standards Commission and were in effect as of September 30, 2025.  The 
City Council further finds that some changes and modifications are of an 
administrative or procedural nature, or concern themselves with subjects not 
covered by the code, or are reasonably necessary to safeguard life and property 
within the City. The City Council hereby adopts the following (Climatic, geological, 
and topographical, where applicable) findings to support the proposed 
amendments to the 2025 California Residential Code made in this Ordinance: 

 
I. Climatic Conditions 

 
A. The jurisdiction of the City of Downey (or, "City") is located in a semi-

arid Mediterranean type climate. It annually experiences extended 
periods of high temperatures with little or no precipitation. For 
example, during July, August and September, temperatures often 
exceed 100 degrees Fahrenheit During the same months humidity 
is usually less than 40%, and humidity measurements less than 10% 
are not uncommon. These conditions contribute to an increased 
likelihood of fire. Moreover, minor fires have a greater tendency of 
spreading rapidly due to such conditions. The City, being in the 
Southern California area, is also subject to "Sundowner" or "Santa 
Ana" winds that, should a fire occur, cause the fire to spread rapidly 
over wood shake roofs which are common in the residential areas. 
These hot, dry (Santa Ana) winds may reach speeds of 70 M.P.H. 
or greater. These climatic conditions cause extreme drying of 
vegetation and common building materials. Frequent periods of 
drought and low humidity add to the fire danger. This predisposes 
the area to large destructive fires (conflagration). In addition to 
directly damaging or destroying buildings, these fires are also prone 
to disrupt utility services throughout the City. Obstacles generated 
by a strong wind, such as fallen trees, street lights and utility poles, 
and the requirement to climb 75 feet vertically up flights of stairs will 
greatly impact the response time to reach an incident scene. 
Additionally, there is a significant increase in the amount of wind 
force at 60 feet above the ground. Use of aerial type fire-fighting 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1533 
PAGE 4 
 
  

apparatus above this height would place rescue personnel at 
increased risk of injury. 

B. Water demand in this densely populated area far exceeds the 
quantity supplied by natural precipitation; and although the 
population continues to grow, the already taxed water supply does 
not. California is projected to increase in population by nearly 10 
million over the next quarter of a century with 50 percent of that 
growth centered in Southern California. Due to storage capacities 
and consumption, and a limited amount of rainfall, future water 
allocation is not fully dependable. This necessitates the need for 
additional and on-site fire protection features. It would also leave tall 
buildings vulnerable to uncontrolled fires due to a lack of available 
water and an inability to pump sufficient quantities of available water 
to floors in a fire. 

C. These dry climatic conditions and winds contribute to the rapid 
spread of even small fires originating in high-density housing or 
vegetation. These fires spread very quickly and create a need for 
increased levels of fire protection. The added protection of fire 
sprinkler systems and other fire protection features will supplement 
normal fire department response by providing immediate protection 
for the building occupants and by containing and controlling the fire 
spread to the area of origin. Fire sprinkler systems will also reduce 
the use of water for firefighting by as much as 50 to 75 percent. 

II. Topographical conditions 

A. Development has occurred in the City and continues to occur in the 
City and such development has resulted in severe traffic congestion 
during peak business hours, weekends and holidays, thus 
decreasing the response time of fire and emergency service 
vehicles, particularly on the following streets and highways: 
Florence Avenue, Firestone Boulevard, Imperial Highway, 
Paramount Boulevard, Lakewood Boulevard, Brookshire Avenue, 
Bellflower Boulevard. 

 
B. These topographical conditions combine to create a situation which 

places fire department response time to fire occurrences at risk, and 
makes it necessary to provide automatic on-site fire-extinguishing 
systems and other protection measures to protect occupants and 
property. Due to these topographical conditions and the expected 
infrastructure damage inherent in seismic zones described below, it 
is prudent to rely on automatic fire sprinkler systems to mitigate 
extended fire department response time and keep fires manageable 
with reduced fire flow (water) requirements for a given structure. 
Numerous fires have occurred within the City in residential structures 
(houses, apartments, hotels, motels, and dormitories) over the past 
several years that have automatic fire protection systems, and in all 
of these fires, the automatic fire protection systems have 
successfully controlled and/or suppressed the fire before the 
emergency response personnel have been able to arrive at the 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1533 
PAGE 5 
 
  

structure. Additional fire protection is also justified to match the 
current resources of firefighting equipment and personnel within the 
fire department. 

Ill. Geological Conditions 
 

A. The City of Downey is located in Southern California, in an extremely 
active seismic region, with high levels of historic earthquake shaking 
in the recent past (earthquakes measuring larger than a magnitude 
5 on the Richter Scale) and can be expected to experience 
significant strong ground shaking within the foreseeable future. The 
City is a densely populated area that has buildings constructed over 
and near a vast and complex network of faults that increase the 
likelihood of catastrophic damage when a seismic event occurs and 
which are believed to be capable of producing future earthquakes 
similar or greater in size to the 1994 Northridge, the 1987 Whittier 
Narrows Earthquake, the 1971 Sylmar earthquakes and 1933 long 
Beach Earthquake. 
 
The seismotectonic setting of the City is dominated by the Norwalk 
fault, which traverses the northern portion of the City. The City is 
also in close proximity to the San Andreas Fault, which is located 40 
miles to the northeast, the Whittier fault, located 10 miles to the 
northeast and the Newport-Inglewood fault, located 10 miles to the 
southwest. In the event of a severe earthquake, these faults present 
the potential for catastrophic damage, including fire, damage to 
roadways and other impairments of emergency apparatus. Existing 
and planned developments are at risk from structural damage from 
earthquake faults. Improved standards are necessary to ensure that 
maximum safety is provided to persons and property. 

 
B. Previous earthquakes have been accompanied by disruption of 

traffic flow and fires. A severe seismic event has the potential to 
negatively impact any rescue or fire suppression activities because 
it is likely to create obstacles similar to those indicated under the 
high wind section above. This situation creates the need for both 
additional fire protection and automatic on-site fire protection for 
building occupants. 

 
IV.  The findings above are applicable to the Amendments to the 2025 

Edition of the California Residential Code as follows: 
  



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1533 
PAGE 6 
 
  
 

2025 
CRC Section 
Amended or 

Added 

 
 

TITLE/DESCRIPTION 

Findings 
(Administrative, 

I, II, Ill) 
R301.1.3.2 Amend CRC Section R301.1.3.2, "Woodframe Structures" Ill 
R301.1.5 Add CRC Section R301.1.5, "Seismic Design Provisions for 

Buildings on Slopes Steeper than 33%" 
Ill 

R301.2.2.6 Amend CRC Section R301.2.2.6, "Irregular Buildings," Items 1, 
3 and 5 

Ill 

R301.2.2.11 Add CRC Section R301.2.2.11, "Anchorage of Mechanical, 
Electrical, or Plumbing Components and Equipment" 

Ill 

R401.1 Amend CRC Section R401.1, "Application" Ill 
R403.1.2, Amend CRC Section R403.1.2, "Continuous Footing in 

Seismic Design Categories Do, D1 and D2" 
Ill 

R403.1.3.6 R403.1.3.6, "Isolated Concrete Footings" Ill 
R403.1.5 R403.1.5 "Slope" Ill 
R404.2 Amend CRC Section R404.2, "Wood Foundation Walls" Ill 
R501.1 Amend CRC Section R501.2, "Application" Ill 

R503.2.4 Add CRC Section R503.2.4, "Openings In Horizontal 
Diaphragms" 

Ill 

Table 
R602.3(1) 

Amend CRC Table R602.3(1), "Fastening Schedule" Ill 

R602.3.2 and 
Table R602.3.2 

Amend Exception to CRC Section R602.3.2 and Table 
R602.3.2, "Top-Plate Splice Connection Details" 

Ill 

Table 
R602.3(2) 

Amend Footnote "b" of CRC Table R602.3(2), "Alternate 
Attachments to Table R602.3(1)" 

I 

R602.10.2.3 Amend CRC Section R602.10.2.3, "Minimum Number of 
Braced Wall Panels" 

II 

Table 
R602.10.3(3) 

Amend CRC Table R602.10.3(3), "Bracing Requirements 
Based on Seismic Design Category" 

Ill 

Table 
R602.10.4 

Amend CRC Table R602.10.4, "Bracing Methods" Ill 

Table 
R602.10.5 

Amend CRC Table R602.10.5, "Minimum Length of Braced 
Wall Panels" 

Ill 

Figure 
R602.10.6.1 

Amend CRC Figure R602.10.6.1, "Method ABW - Alternate 
Braced Wall Panel" 

Ill 

Figure 
R602.10.6.2 

Amend CRC Figure R602.10.6.2, "Method PFH - Portal Frame 
with Hold-downs at Detached Garage Door Openings" 

Ill 

Figure 
R602.10.6.4 

Amend CRC Figure R602.10.6.4, "Method CS-PF- 
Continuously Sheathed Portal Framed Construction" 

Ill 

R606.4.4 Amend CRC Section R606.4.4, "Parapet Walls" Ill 

R606.12.2.2.3 Amend CRC Section R606.12.2.2.3, 
"Reinforcement Requirements for Masonry Elements" 

Ill 

R803.2.4 Add CRC Section R803.2.4, "Openings in Horizontal 
Diaphragms" 

Ill 

R1001.3.1 Amend CRC Section R1001.3.1, "Vertical Reinforcing" Ill 

 
 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1533 
PAGE 7 
 
  

SECTION 2: That Chapter 13 ("Downey Residential Code") of Article 
VIII ("Building Regulations") of the Downey Municipal Code set forth below 
hereby replaces the existing Chapter 13 to read as follows: 

 
 
 

"CHAPTER 13  
DOWNEY RESIDENTIAL CODE 

 
§ 8993 - Adoption by Reference of California Residential Code. Except 
as provided herein, the 2025 Edition of the California Residential Code, 
(California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 2.5), based upon the 2024 
International Residential Code, including Appendix BB, (Tiny Houses), BF 
(Patio Covers), BG (Sound Transmission), and C1 (Swimming Pool Safety 
Act), is hereby adopted by reference as though fully set forth herein, and shall 
constitute and is hereby established as the "Downey Building Code." A copy 
of the 2025 Edition of the California Residential Code is on file in the Building 
and Safety Division and the Office of the City Clerk for use and examination by 
the public. 

 
§ 8994 - Section R301.1.3.2 of the 2025 Edition of the California Residential 
Code is amended to read as follows: 

 
R301.1.3.2 Woodframe structures. The building official shall require 
construction documents to be approved and stamped by a California 
licensed architect or engineer for all dwellings of woodframe construction 
more than two stories and basement in height located in Seismic Design 
Category A, B or C. Notwithstanding other sections of law; the law 
establishing these provisions is found in Business and Professions Code 
Sections 5537 and 6737.1. 

 
The building official shall require construction documents to be approved and 
stamped by a California licensed architect or engineer for all dwellings of 
woodframe construction more than one story in height or with a basement 
located in Seismic Design Category D0, D1, or D2. 

 
§ 8995 - Section R301.1.5 is added to Chapter 3 of the 2025 Edition of the 
California Residential Code to read as follows: 

 
R301.1.5 Seismic design provisions for buildings constructed on or into slopes 
steeper than one unit vertical in three units horizontal (33.3 percent slope). The 
design and construction of new buildings and additions to existing buildings 
when constructed on or into slopes steeper than one unit vertical in three units 
horizontal (33.3 percent slope) shall comply with Section 1613.6 of the 
California Building Code. 

 
§ 8996 - Items 1, 3, and 5 of Section R301.2.2.6 of the 2025 Edition of the 
California Residential Code are amended to read as follows: 

 
1. Shear wall or braced wall offsets out of plane. Conditions where 

exterior shear wall lines or braced wall panels are not in one plane vertically 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1533 
PAGE 8 
 
  

from the foundation to the uppermost story in which they are required. 
 

3. Shear wall or braced wall offsets in plane. Conditions where the end of 
a braced wall panel occurs over an opening in the wall below. 

5. Floor level offset. Conditions where portions of a floor level are vertically offset 
 

§ 8997 - Section R301.2.2.11 is added to Chapter 3 of the 2025 Edition of the 
California Residential Code to read as follows: 

 
R301.2.2.11 Anchorage of mechanical, electrical, or plumbing 
components and equipment. Mechanical, electrical, or plumbing components 
and equipment shall be anchored to the structure. Anchorage of the 
components and equipment shall be designed to resist loads in accordance 
with the California Building Code and ASCE 7, except where the component is 
positively attached to the structure and flexible connections are provided 
between the component and associated ductwork, piping, and conduit; and 
either 

 
1. The component weighs 400 lb (1,780 N) or less and has a center of 

mass located 4 ft (1.22 m) or less above the supporting structure; or 
 

2. The component weighs 20 lb (89N) or less or, in the case of a 
distributed system, 
5 lb/ft (73 N/m) or less. 

 
§ 8998 - Section R401.1 of the 2025 Edition of the California Residential 
Code is amended to read as follows: 

 
R401.1 Application. The provisions of this chapter shall control the design and 
construction of the foundation and foundation spaces for buildings. In addition 
to the provisions of this chapter, the design and construction of foundations in 
flood hazard areas as established by Table R301.2 shall meet the provisions of 
Section R322. Wood foundations shall be designed and installed in accordance 
with AWC PWF. 

 
Exception: The provisions of this chapter shall be permitted to be 
used for wood foundations only in the following situations: 

 
1. In buildings that have no more than two floors and a root 

 
2. When interior basement and foundation walls are constructed 

at intervals not exceeding 50 feet (15 240 mm). 
 

Wood foundations in Seismic Design Category D0, D1, or D2 shall not be permitted. 
 

Exception: In non-occupied, single-story, detached storage sheds and 
similar uses other than carport or garage, provided the gross floor area does 
not exceed 200 square feet, the plate height does not exceed 12 feet in 
height above the grade plane at any point, and the maximum roof projection 
does not exceed 24 inches. 

 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1533 
PAGE 9 
 
  

§ 8999 - Sections R403.1.2, R403.1.3.6, and R403.1.5 of the 2025 Edition 
of the California Residential Code are amended to read as follows: 

 
R403.1.2 Continuous footing in Seismic Design Categories D0, D1, or D2. 
Exterior walls of buildings located in Seismic Design Categories D0, D1, or D2 
shall be supported by continuous solid or fully grouted masonry or concrete 
footings. All required interior braced wall panels in buildings located in Seismic 
Design Categories D0, D1, or D2 shall be supported on continuous foundations. 

 
R403.1.3.6 Isolated concrete footings. In detached one- and two-family 
dwellings located in Seismic Design Category A, B, or C, that are three stories 
or less in height, and constructed with stud bearing walls, isolated plain concrete 
footings supporting columns or pedestals are permitted. 

 
R403.1.5 Slope. The top surface of footings shall be level. The bottom surface 
of footings shall not have a slope exceeding one unit vertical in 10 units 
horizontal (10-percent slope). Footings shall be stepped where it is necessary 
to change the elevation of the top surface of the footings or where the slope of 
the bottom surface of the footings will exceed one unit vertical in 10 units 
horizontal (10-percent slope). 

 
For structures assigned to Seismic Design Categories D0, D1, or D2, stepped 
footings shall be reinforced with four No. 4 rebar. Two bars shall be place at the 
top and bottom of the footings as shown in Figure R403.1.5. 

 

 

§ 8999.1 - Section R404.2 of the 2025 Edition of the California Residential 
Code is amended to read as follows: 

R404.2 Wood foundation walls. Wood foundation walls shall be constructed 
in accordance with the provisions of Sections R404.2.1 through R404.2.6 and 
with the details shown in Figures R403.1(2) and R403.1(3). Wood foundation 
walls shall not be used for structures located in Seismic Design Category D0, 
D1, or D2. 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1533 
PAGE 10 
 
  
 

§ 8999.2 - Section R501.1 of the 2025 Edition of the California Residential 
Code is amended to read as follows: 

 
R501.1 Application. The provisions of this chapter shall control the design and 
construction of the floors for buildings, including the floors of attic spaces used 
to house mechanical or plumbing fixtures and equipment. Mechanical or 
plumbing fixtures and equipment shall be attached or anchored to the structure 
in accordance with Section R301.2.2.11. 

 
§ 8999.3 - Section R503.2.4 is added to Chapter 5 of the 2025 Edition of the 
California Residential Code to read as follows: 

 
R503.2.4 Openings in horizontal diaphragms. Openings in horizontal 
diaphragms with a dimension perpendicular to the joist that is greater than 4 
feet (1.2 m) shall be constructed in accordance with Figure R503.2.4. 

 

 
FIGURE R503.2.4 

OPENINGS IN HORIZONTAL DIAPHRAGMS 
 

Notes: 
a. Blackings shall be provided beyond headers. 
b. Metal ties not less than 0.058 inch [1.47 mm (16 galvanized gage)] by 1.5 inches 

(38 mm) wide with eight 16d common nails on each side of the header-joist 
intersection. The metal ties shall have a minimum yield of 33,000 psi (227 
MPa). 

c. Openings in diaphragms shall be further limited in accordance with Section R301.2.2.6. 
 
 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1533 
PAGE 11 
 
  

§ 8999.4 - Items 20, 21, 24, and 34 through 37, inclusive, of Table R602.3(1) of 
the 2025 Edition of the California Residential Code are amended to read as 
follows: 

 
TABLE R602.3(1) 

FASTENING SCHEDULE 

 
ITEM DESCRIPTION OF 

BUILDING ELEMENTS 
NUMBER AND TYPE OF 
FASTENER a, b, c 

SPACING AND 
LOCATION 

Roof 
 

20k 
 
1” x 6" sheathing to each 
bearing 

3-8d box (2 ½" x 0.113”); 
or 2-8d common (2 ½”  x 
0.131”); or 2-10d box (3" 
x 0.128”); or 
2 staples, 1” crown, 16 ga., 13/4" long 

 
Face nail 

 
 

 
21k 

 
 

 
1” x 8” and wider sheathing to 
each bearing 

3-8d box (21/2"x 0.113”); or 
3-8d common (2 ½” x 
0.131”); or 3-10d box (3" x 
0.128”); or 
3 staples, 1” crown, 16 ga., 1 ¾” long 

 
 

 
Face nail 

Wider than 1” x 8” 

4-8d box (2 ½” x 0.113”); or 
3-8d common (2 ½” x 
0.131 “); or 3-10d box (3" 
x 0.128”); or 
4 staples, 1” crown, 16 ga., 1 ¾” long 

Floor 
 

24k 
 
1 " x 6" subfloor or less to each 
joist 

3-8d box (2 ½” x 0.113”); or 
2-8d common (2 ½” x 
0.131 “); or 3-10d box (3" x 
0.128”); or 
2 staples, 1" crown, 16 ga., 1 ¾” long 

 
Face nail 

Other wall sheathingg 
 

34k 1/2" structural 
cellulosic fiberboard 
sheathing 

1 ½” galvanized roofing nail, 7/15" 
head diameter, or 1 ¼” long 16 ga. 
staple with 7/16" or 1" crown / 

 
3 

 
6 

35k 25/32”  structural 
cellulosic fiberboard 
sheathing 

1 ¾” galvanized roofing nail, 7/16" 
head diameter, or 1 ½” long 16 ga. 
staple with 7/16" or 1"crown 

3 6 

36k 1/2" gypsum sheathingd 1 ½” galvanized roofing nail; staple 
galvanized, 1 ½” long; 1 ¼” screws, 
Type W or S 

7 7 

37k 5/8" gypsum sheathingd 1 ¾”  galvanized roofing nail; staple 
galvanized, 1 5/8” long; 1 5/8” screws, 
Type W or S 

7 7 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1533 
PAGE 12 
 
  

For SI: 1 inch= 25.4 mm, 1 foot= 304.8 mm, 1 mile per hour= 0.447 mis; 1 ksi = 6.895 MPa. 
 

k. Use of staples in braced wall panels shall be prohibited in Seismic Design 
Category D0, D1, or D2. 

 
 

§ 8999.5 - Footnote "b" of Table R602.3(2) of the 2025 Edition of the 
California Residential Code is amended to read as follows: 

 
b. Staples shall have a minimum crown width of 7/16-inch on diameter except as 

noted. Use of staples in braced wall panels shall be prohibited in Seismic 
Design Category D0, D1, or D2. 

 
§ 8999.6 - Exception to Section R602.3.2 and Table R602.3.2 of the 2025 Edition 
of the California Residential Code are amended to read as follows: 

 
Exception: In other than Seismic Design Category D0, D1, or D2, a single top 
plate used as an alternative to a double top plate shall comply with the following: 

 
1. The single top plate shall be tied at corners, intersecting walls, and at 

in-line splices in straight wall lines in accordance with Table R602.3.2. 
2. The rafters or joists shall be centered over the studs with a tolerance of 

not more than 1 inch (25 mm). 
3. Omission of the top plate is permitted over headers where the headers 

are adequately tied to adjacent wall sections in accordance with Table 
R602.3.2. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
§ 8999.7 - Section R602.10.2.3 of the 2025 Edition of the California Residential 
Code is amended to read as follows: 

 
R602.10.2.3 Minimum number of braced wall panels. Braced wall lines with 
a length of 16 feet (4,877 mm) or less shall have not less than two braced wall 
panels of any length or one braced wall panel equal to 48 inches (1,219 mm) 
or more. Braced wall lines greater than 16 feet (4,877 mm) shall have not less 
than two braced wall panels. In Seismic Design Category D0, D1, or D2 n0 braced 
wall panel shall a contributing length less than 48 inches in length or as required 
in Section R602.10.3, whichever is greater. 

 
§ 8999.8 - Table R602.10.3(3) of the 2025 Edition of the California Residential 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1533 
PAGE 13 
 
  

Code is amended to read as follows: 
 

 
 



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1533 
PAGE 14 
 
  

 
 

 

a. Linear interpolation shall be permitted. 
b. Interpolation of bracing length between the Sds values associated with the 

seismic design categories shall be permitted when a site-specific Sds value is 
determined in accordance with Section 1613.2 of the California Building Code. 

c. Where the braced wall line length is greater than 50 feet, braced wall lines shall 
be permitted to be divided into shorter segments having lengths of 50 feet or less, 
and the amount of bracing within each segment shall be in accordance with this 
table. 

d. Method LIB shall have gypsum board fastened to not less than one side with 
nails or screws in accordance with Table R602.3(1) for exterior sheathing or 
Table R702.3.5 for interior gypsum board. Spacing of fasteners at panel edges 






















































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































































	CityCouncilClosed&OpenSessions_2026-01-13
	1. }-ADOPTIONOF

